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Duncan Clark <D.Clark@jfdglobal.com> 2 April 2018 at 08:47
To: Steve Nixon <steve.nixon@vandagraphst.com>

Good morning Steve,

 

Please see JFD comments below in red, you can also find a�ached the amended terms.

 

 

 

3.1 Currently the sensors are supplied CPT, but looking at item 3.1 it infers that we cover the insurance. Do you want us to add the UPS
insurance at 1% of the invoice total, as stated on the price list? If so, could you please add it to the purchase orders or I could update the
price list  JFD has its own transportation insurance.

 

3.10 This would be difficult to apply in regard to the sensors and we would deliver goods as per the specifications. However, this clause is
open ended as far as costs are concerned. Clause 3.10 deleted.  

 

8 (8.1 & 8.2)  The sensors are a custom device made to your specifications. So, if the product is supplied as per the specification we can't be
expected to accept returns, other than in respect of warranty claims. Clause 8 deleted.

 

14.4 & 14.5  Again as the sensors are a custom design we can't be expected to be subject to these clauses. Clauses 14.4 & 14.5 deleted.

 

Best regards

 

Duncan

 

 

 

 

Duncan Clark Purchasing Manager  
D.Clark@jfdglobal.com   
 
JFD - United Kingdom  
Office: +44 (0)1224 740145 / Fax: +44 (0)1224 740172  
Enterprise Drive, Westhill, AB32 6TQ  
United Kingdom  
jfdglobal.com

Follow us on:

        

 

JFD is the trading name of JFD Ltd. Registered in Scotland, No: SC123684 with Registered office: JFD Ltd c/o James Fisher Offshore, North Meadows, Oldmeldrum, Aberdeenshire, AB51 0GQ  
 
This email and any attachments are confidential and may contain proprietary information, some of which may be legally privileged. It is intended solely for the use of the individual or entity to which it is addressed. If you are not the
intended recipient, please notify the author immediately by replying to this email, and then delete all copies of the e-mail from your system. If you are not the intended recipient you must not use, disclose, distribute, copy, print or
rely on this email. 

From: steve.nixon.viamed@googlemail.com [mailto:steve.nixon.viamed@googlemail.com] On Behalf Of Steve Nixon 
Sent: 26 March 2018 15:05 
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To: Duncan Clark 
Subject: Re: JFD DB200381 oxygen sensor

 

Hi Duncan

 

Obviously you have supplied the general terms and conditions, but I have the following queries and concerns:

 

 

3.1 Currently the sensors are supplied CPT, but looking at item 3.1 it infers that we cover the insurance. Do you want us to add the UPS
insurance at 1% of the invoice total, as stated on the price list? If so, could you please add it to the purchase orders or I could update the
price list

 

3.10 This would be difficult to apply in regard to the sensors and we would deliver goods as per the specifications. However, this clause is
open ended as far as costs are concerned.

 

8 (8.1 & 8.2)  The sensors are a custom device made to your specifications. So, if the product is supplied as per the specification we can't be
expected to accept returns, other than in respect of warranty claims.

 

14.4 & 14.5  Again as the sensors are a custom design we can't be expected to be subject to these clauses.

 

 

Steve

 

On 23 March 2018 at 10:27, Duncan Clark <D.Clark@jfdglobal.com> wrote:

Morning Steve,

 

Thanks for this informa�on much appreciated. Could you please review our standard T&C’s or purchase a�ached and advise of any
queries or concerns.

 

Best regards

 

Duncan

 

 

 

Duncan Clark Purchasing Manager  
D.Clark@jfdglobal.com   
 
JFD - United Kingdom  
Office: +44 (0)1224 740145 / Fax: +44 (0)1224 740172  
Enterprise Drive, Westhill, AB32 6TQ  
United Kingdom  
jfdglobal.com

Follow us on:

      

 

JFD is the trading name of JFD Ltd. Registered in Scotland, No: SC123684 with Registered office: JFD Ltd c/o James Fisher Offshore, North Meadows, Oldmeldrum, Aberdeenshire, AB51 0GQ  

 

mailto:D.Clark@jfdglobal.com
mailto:D.Clark@jfdglobal.com
http://jfdglobal.com/
https://goo.gl/wQhUfI
https://goo.gl/Bfk7HJ
https://goo.gl/eabXzD
https://goo.gl/RtL4Jz


08/05/2018 Gmail - RE: JFD DB200381 oxygen sensor

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ui=2&ik=9b98bff2a5&jsver=KU8lXMCUf4Q.en_GB.&cbl=gmail_fe_180429.15_p3&view=pt&q=duncan&qs=true&search=query&

This email and any attachments are confidential and may contain proprietary information, some of which may be legally privileged. It is intended solely for the use of the individual or entity to which it is addressed. If you are not the

intended recipient, please notify the author immediately by replying to this email, and then delete all copies of the e-mail from your system. If you are not the intended recipient you must not use, disclose, distribute, copy, print or

rely on this email.

From: steve.nixon.viamed@googlemail.com [mailto:steve.nixon.viamed@googlemail.com] On Behalf Of Steve Nixon 
Sent: 22 March 2018 17:11 
To: Duncan Clark 
Subject: JFD DB200381 oxygen sensor

 

Hi Duncan

 

Further to our discussion, please find pricing attached. I have enclosed a draft copy of the sensor specifications, which I'll update with the
dimensional change.

 

 

Regards

 

--

 

 

Steve

 

 

Steve Nixon

Director - Vandagraph Sensor Technologies Ltd.

 

Office:  +44 (0)1535 634900

Mobile: +44 (0)7850 252267

 

 

--

Steve

 

 

Steve Nixon

Director - Viamed Ltd.

 

Office:  +44 (0)1535 634542

Mobile: +44 (0)7850 252267
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