13/01/2025, 12:03 Gmail - Re: Foetal Simulator Sales

M Gmail

Re: Foetal Simulator Sales
1 message

Steve Nixon <steve.nixon@viamed.co.uk>
To: DAVID BROUGH <david.brough@virgin.net>

Steve Nixon <steve.nixon.viamed@googlemail.com>

Cc: Les Scott <lascott@ntlworld.com>, Helen Lamb <helen.lamb@yviamed.co.uk>

Bcc: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com>
Hi Dave

| will ask Helen to transfer payment of £659.00

V1000 Sales - 01-10-2024 to 31-12-2024

Account Date Invoice Qty
CID2862 08-Oct-24 RWVM152494-1 1
CID3204 10-Oct-24 RVM152720-1 1
CID2873 11-Nov-24 RVM152894-1 1
Cl1D2929 19-MNov-24 RVM152581-1 1
CID3172 30-Dec-24 RWVM153868-1 1
Totals 5
Sales to UK
Regards
Steve

On Mon, 6 Jan 2025 at 12:47, DAVID BROUGH <david.brough@yvirgin.net> wrote:

Hi Steve

Hope your doing well. Happy 2025. Do you have the sales figures for the V1000 for Q4 20247

Regards
Dave

Steve

Steve Nixon

Director - Viamed Ltd.
Office: +44 (0)1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0)7850 252267

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=9b98bff2a5&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f:1820503720957315857%7Cmsg-a:r-5192959255111105...

GEP
£659.00
£659.00
£659.00
£659.00
£659.00

£3,295.00

13 January 2025 at 12:02

£131.80
£131.30
£131.80
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£659.00
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