04/05/2020 Gmail - Re: T-7 sensors

M Gma" Steve Nixon <steve.nixon.viamed@googlemail.com>

Re: T-7 sensors
1 message

Mehul Doshi <mehul.doshi@cabinetoffice.gov.uk> 4 May 2020 at 16:50
To: steve.nixon@viamed.co.uk
Cc: Helen Lamb <helen.lamb@viamed.co.uk>

Hi Steve

Here are the details for DHSC bank. Please can you use reference "Covid19 — Viamed Ltd Refund".

Sort code 60-70-80 Account type BUSINESS CURRENT
Number 10020985 Bank name National Westminster Bank

Currency GBP Branch name GOVERNMENT BNKG SERV BRANCH
Alias. ‘GBS RE DH HGC INC Paper statement produced 19/03/2020
Short name: DHSC HGC BIC NWBKGB2L
IBAN ‘GBISNWBKE0T08010020985
Thanks
Mehul
) I i Mehul Doshi
Part of NHS-DHSC Oxygen & Ventilator Programme
' H E: mehul.doshi@cabinetoffice.gov.uk M: 07562438988
Cabinet Office e ¢
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On Mon, 4 May 2020 at 14:21, Steve Nixon <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Hi Mehul
OK, not a problem.
Payment received on 14/04/20  £144,672.00 DHSC Health GEN AC P/F INV MVM123269 BGC

21/04/20 299 sensors shipped RVM123269-1 £19,662.24
21/04/20 1 sensor shipped RVM123460-1 £ 65.76

So, total to refund for oxygen sensors not now required: £124,944.00

Steve

On Mon, 4 May 2020 at 11:00, Mehul Doshi <mehul.doshi@cabinetoffice.gov.uk> wrote:
Hi Steve

Let's proceed with the refund for the balance of the 1900 units.

Can you let me know the exact amount to be refunded and | will pass on to finance. They will provide details for refund processing,
including bank account details.

Thanks
Mehul
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On Sat, 2 May 2020 at 13:04, Steve Nixon <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Hi Mehul

As you know we supplied 300 x T-7 (ref. MOX-4) oxygen sensors at short notice to try and ease the emergency situation. In total you
ordered 2,200 sensors, so there was a balance of 1,900. After subsequent discussion | was under the impression that you no longer
needed the sensors and we were to refund the balance payment.

If the situation is now that you may need some or all of the remaining 1,900 sensors can you please provide me with an update of your
requirements in terms of timescales and batch quantities..
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As discussed, we already have production backed-up for several months. However, | may be able to make a few adjustments in a few
weeks time.

Regards

Steve

On Fri, 1 May 2020 at 15:57, Steve Nixon <steve.nixon@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Hi Mehul

| was under the impression that you only wanted the first delivery and we were to refund the balance of the funds.

My understanding was that the supply with the vents had been resolved and this was also backed up by what your Scottish
Government colleague said following the meeting that you all had.

Steve
On Fri, 1 May 2020 at 15:35, Mehul Doshi <mehul.doshi@cabinetoffice.gov.uk> wrote:

Hi Steve

I've not seen any further deliveries since last week. I'm waiting for an update from Scottish government colleagues about their
requirements for sensors.

| will get back to you next week about what our future requirements are, and whether we will need to get a refund on the
outstanding orders.

Thanks
Mehul
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