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Steve Nixon <steve.nixon.viamed@googlemail.com>

RE: Purchase order POR11911 
1 message

Grace Lee (GM_李芸芳) <grace.lee@galemed.com> 27 September 2018 at 04:13
To: "steve.nixon@viamed.co.uk" <steve.nixon@viamed.co.uk>
Cc: Amanda Chien <amanda.chien@galemed.com>

Dear Steve,
 
Thanks for your information.
 
Please find attached PI for your reference. 
The shipment date is October 17th,2018 ship from Taiwan
 
Since our Xiamen factory is located at bonded port area,there is some restriction on courier and only accept to ship
by Fedex and DHL because UPS does not have contract with bonded warehouse this year. 
 
Therefore,we will arrange to ship this order from our Taiwan factory for your convenience.
We will arrange the shipment by your UPS account 9W9638
Hope this is ok for you.
 
Kindly help to arrange the payment to our Taiwan bank account (as below)
 

Bank details: 

Swi� Code :ICBCTWTP062
Bank Name :MEGA INTERNATIONAL COMMERCIAL BANK CO., LTD. I LAN BRANCH
A/C No. : 062-53-00112-6
A/C name :GaleMed Corpora�on
 

 
And another thing is we just change to use new system from September,2017.
We have to update account information in our new system and would like to seek for your assistance to provide
below information for our updating.
 
*Viamed Limited's paid-up capital amount
*Viamed Limited's Tax ID
 
Kindly check and advise.        Thank you.
 
Best Regards,
 
Grace Lee 李芸芳

Customer Service in Own Brand Sales team  
 
GaleMed Corporation 崇仁科技事業股份有限公司

T +886-3-990-8618 ext 276  F +886-3-990-8245 
87,Li-gong 2nd Road,Wu-jia,I-Lan Hsien 26841, Taiwan
26841 台灣省宜蘭縣五結鄉利工二路87號
www.galemed.com | Email: grace.lee@galemed.com 
The informa�on contained in, or a�ached to, this e-mail, may contain confiden�al informa�on and is intended solely for the use of the individual or en�ty to whom
they are addressed and may be subject to legal privilege. If you have received this e-mail in error you should no�fy the sender immediately by reply e-mail, delete the
message from your system. Please do not copy it for any purpose, or disclose its contents to any other person. The views or opinions presented in this e-mail are solely
those of the author and do not necessarily represent those of the company. The recipient should check this e-mail and any a�achments for the presence of viruses.
GaleMed reserves the right to retain all messages. Messages are protected and accessed only in legally jus�fied cases.
 
 
 

寄件者: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> 代表 Steve Nixon <office@viamed.co.uk> 
寄件日期: 2018年9月26日 下午 05:03 
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收件者: Grace Lee (GM_李芸芳) 
主旨: Re: Purchase order POR11911
 
Hi Grace
 
Please amend the order to 1,000 pieces (see updated order attached). Do you have a shipper or should we use
UPS using our account 9W9638
 
When can you ship the goods? Also what is the manufacturing date and expiry date?
 
On Tue, 25 Sep 2018 at 08:39, Grace Lee (GM_李芸芳) <grace.lee@galemed.com> wrote: 

Hi Steve,
 
Thanks for your new order.
 
However,please kindly understand that our MOQ for 74053 is 1,000pcs
Package information is 100pc/pkg,10pkg/ctn
 
Kindly check if you accept to amend the quantity to 1,000pcs.
 
Thank you.
 
Best Regards,
 
Grace Lee 李芸芳

Customer Service in Own Brand Sales team  
 
GaleMed Corporation 崇仁科技事業股份有限公司

T +886-3-990-8618 ext 276  F +886-3-990-8245 
87,Li-gong 2nd Road,Wu-jia,I-Lan Hsien 26841, Taiwan
26841 台灣省宜蘭縣五結鄉利工二路87號
www.galemed.com | Email: grace.lee@galemed.com 
The informa�on contained in, or a�ached to, this e-mail, may contain confiden�al informa�on and is intended solely for the use of the individual or en�ty to whom
they are addressed and may be subject to legal privilege. If you have received this e-mail in error you should no�fy the sender immediately by reply e-mail, delete
the message from your system. Please do not copy it for any purpose, or disclose its contents to any other person. The views or opinions presented in this e-mail are
solely those of the author and do not necessarily represent those of the company. The recipient should check this e-mail and any a�achments for the presence of
viruses. GaleMed reserves the right to retain all messages. Messages are protected and accessed only in legally jus�fied cases.
 
 
 

寄件者: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> 代表 Steve Nixon <office@viamed.co.uk> 
寄件日期: 2018年9月24日 下午 07:44 
收件者: Grace Lee (GM_李芸芳) 
副本: James.Lee(GM_李俊霖); Claire.Chuang(GM_莊雅涵) 
主旨: Purchase order POR11911
 
Hi, due to delays in processing standards, approvals and clinical trials we would like to purchase some more
samples of connectors, before we place production quantities.
 
In view of this can you please process the attached order.
 
Regards 
 
--  
Steve
 
 
Steve Nixon
Director - Viamed Ltd.
 
Office:  +44 (0)1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0)7850 252267
 
 

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy  
. 
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--  
Steve
 
 
Steve Nixon
Director - Viamed Ltd.
 
Office:  +44 (0)1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0)7850 252267
 
 

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy  
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PI Viamed 2100006169 for POR11911.pdf 
43K
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