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Steve Nixon <steve.nixon.viamed@googlemail.com> 14 March 2018 at 15:50
To: Derek Lamb <derek@lamb.uk.net>, John Lamb <john@lamb.uk.net>

 
 
Please see the attached offer, for discussion. This just covers the medical version sensor in the region of 10 - 100% O2.
 
 
The following is a translation of the offer if you need it.
 
 
Dear Mr. Dipl.-Ing. Schwarz,
 
We are pleased to make you an offer for the following service:
 
"Development of a fast polymer-based O2 sensor for medical applications
for a measuring range of 10-100% O2.
 

1. Development of a new electrode geometry  €22,800.00
 

2. Development of a diffusion system for current limit  €28,500.00

 

3. Development of an adapted sensor control for high sensor dynamics €12,500.00 
 
 

4. Development of a sensor housing   €11,000.00

 

5. Development of drift and dynamics tests   €25,000.00
 
VAT  €  18,962.00
Total €118,762.00
 
 
---------- Forwarded message ---------- 
From: Lindner, Bernd <b.lindner@bluepoint-medical.com> 
Date: 2018-03-06 6:40 GMT+00:00 
Subject: WG: Angebot 20170012 
To: "steve.nixon.viamed@googlemail.com" <steve.nixon.viamed@googlemail.com> 
 
 

Here enclosed the offer from Peter.

Payment based on milestones and/or quarterly.

With best regards

Bernd

Von: J Schwarz [j.schwarz@sensatronic.com] 
Gesendet: Freitag, 2. März 2018 09:55 
An: Lindner, Bernd 
Betreff: WG: Angebot 20170012 
 

Hallo Bernd,

 

hier nochmal das Angebot von Peter. Die Abrechnung erfolgt quartalsweise bzw. nach erreichten Teilschritten.
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Mit freundlichen Grüßen,

Kind regards,

 

Jens Schwarz

 

Sensatronic GmbH

Am Ring 9

D-23970 Wismar, Germany

Tel. +49-3841-2252 440

Fax +49-3841-2252 442

j.schwarz@sensatronic.com

 

Diese E-Mail enthaelt vertrauliche und/oder rechtlich geschuetzte Informationen. Wenn Sie nicht der richtige Adressat sind oder diese E-Mail irrtuemlich erhalten haben, informieren Sie bitte sofort

den Absender und vernichten Sie diese E-Mail. Das unerlaubte Kopieren sowie die unbefugte Weitergabe dieser E-Mail sind nicht gestattet.

 

This e-mail may contain confidential and/or privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient (or have received this e-mail in error) please notify the sender immediately and destroy this e-

mail. Any unauthorized copying, disclosure or distribution of the material in this e-mail is strictly forbidden.

 

Von: office [mailto:office@ecsense.de]  
Gesendet: Mittwoch, 8. November 2017 14:24 
An: J Schwarz <j.schwarz@sensatronic.com> 
Cc: 'Peter Koller' <PfjKoller@web.de>; 'Axel Solbach' <axel.solbach@ecsense.de> 
Betreff: Angebot 20170012

 

Guten Tag Herr Schwarz,

 

wie mit Herrn Solbach und Herrn Koller besprochen,

erhalten Sie im Anhang das gewünschte Angebot zu

der Entwicklung eines schnellen O2 Sensors.

 

Für weitere Fragen stehen wir Ihnen gerne jederzeit

Zur Verfügung.

 

Mit freundlichen Grüßen

 

Kilian Altan
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EC-Sense GmbH

Wolfratshauser Str. 53

82067 Ebenhausen-Schäftlarn

 

Tel. +49 (0)8178 – 9095130

Mobil +49 (0)178 – 6079823

 

Geschäftsführer: Peter Koller, Axel Solbach

USt-ID-Nr. DE298975374

HRB 216696 Amtsgericht München
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