20/09/2022, 16:16

M Gmail

Gmail - RE: FW: O2 monitors

Sophie Lines <viamed.sophie.lines@gmail.com>

RE: FW: O2 monitors

1 message

Mick Smithson <Mick@lamboo-medical.com>
To: "sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk" <sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk>
Cc: Andrea Keegan <Andrea@lamboo-medical.com>

Hi Sophie,

Order number, Stock

Royal mail; will be fine thanks.
Andrea in cc will be able to sort the invoice.
With kind regards / Met vriendelijke groet,

Mick Smithson
Duty Manager

Lamboo Medical UK

E: Mick@lamboo-medical.com
T: +44 (0)0194 2724272
M: +44 (0)7591 827595

24H: +44 (0)7494 653508
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Tue, Sep 20, 2022 at 4:12 PM

b% Please consider the environment before printing this email.
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From: Main Account [mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com] On Behalf Of Sophie Lines
Sent: 20 September 2022 17:09

To: Mick Smithson <Mick@lamboo-medical.com>

Subject: Re: FW: 02 monitors

Hi Mick,

Thank you for your order - do you have an order number you would like me to use for this?

Also please be aware there would be a carriage charge applicable - UPS Next Day Delivery is £10.00, or Royal Mail Recorded Delivery is

£6.00 - both are available with this order - please advise which method you would prefer?
Kind regards
Sophie Lines

Please note: My working days are Monday, Tuesday and Friday

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but please

continue to use email where possible.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Emailsophie.lines@viamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.
If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Tue, Sep 20, 2022 at 3:42 PM Mick Smithson <Mick@lamboo-medical.com> wrote:

Hi Sophie,

Thank you for coming back to me on this.

Could | please order 3 x sensor - R-17MED for delivery to,

FAO Mick Smithson
Lamboo medical
100b Empress Park
Penny lane Haydock

WA11 9DB.
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With kind regards / Met vriendelijke groet,

Mick Smithson
Duty Manager

Lamboo Medical UK

E: Mick@lamboo-medical.com
T: +44 (0)0194 2724272
M: +44 (0)7591 827595

24H: +44 (0)7494 653508

" mobile_medical

m https://www.linkedin.com/company/lamboo-mobile-medical

LAMBOO | S:iithicare
MEDICAL | &Vervwiere

KvK: 27186078

Check also our promotion solutions at:

http://www.mobile-promotion.eu/

b% Please consider the environment before printing this email.

From: Main Account [mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com] On Behalf Of Sophie Lines
Sent: 20 September 2022 16:31

To: Mick Smithson <Mick@lamboo-medical.com>

Subject: Re: FW: 02 monitors

Good afternoon,
Thank you for your email. Sarah Walton no longer works at Viamed, so please accept my reply.

Unfortunately the MX300 Oxygen Monitor which is pictured in your email has now been discontinued and is no longer available for
purchase. Spare parts and the sensor - R-17MED (£34.00 each) are still available - if you would like the price of any of the spare parts
please let me know.

We have some alternative Oxygen Monitors available as follows:
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¢ 0111263 Maxtec - MaxO2 ME Oxygen monitor - £416.00
¢ 0111276 Envitec - Oxygen monitor MySign O - £277.60

(All prices exclude VAT and carriage costs)

| have attached leaflets for these products - if either of these would suit your requirements, please let me know if any further information
is required.

Sophie Lines

Please note: My working days are Monday, Tuesday and Friday

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but
please continue to use email where possible.

http://www.viamed.co.uk
Emailsophie.lines@viamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.
E-mail Disclaimer

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.
If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Tue, Sep 20, 2022 at 9:17 AM Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Mick Smithson <Mick@lamboo-medical.com>

Date: Tue, 20 Sept 2022 at 09:13

Subject: FW: O2 monitors

To: sarah.walton@viamed.co.uk <sarah.walton@viamed.co.uk>

Good Morning Sarah,

Hope your well.

Would it be possible to receive a quote and lead time for both the pictured below.

Sensor and monitor

With kind regards / Met vriendelijke groet,

Mick Smithson
Duty Manager

Lamboo Medical UK
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E: Mick@lamboo-medical.com
T: +44 (0)0194 2724272
M: +44 (0)7591 827595

24H: +44 (0)7494 653508

» mobile_medical

ﬂﬂ https://www.linkedin.com/company/lamboo-mobile-medical

KvK: 27186078

Check also our promotion solutions at:

http://www.mobile-promotion.eu/

b% Please consider the environment before printing this email.

From: Mick Smithson

Sent: 20 September 2022 10:07

To: Mick Smithson <Mick@lamboo-medical.com>
Subject: 02 monitors
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With kind regards / Met vriendelijke groet,

Mick Smithson
Duty Manager
Lamboo Medical UK
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E: Mick@lamboo-medical.com
T. +44 (0)0194 2724272

M: +44 (0)7591 827595

24H: +44 (0)7494 653508
mobile_medical

https://www.linkedin.com/company/lamboo-mobile-medical

KvK: 27186078

Check also our promotion solutions at:

http://www.mobile-promotion.eu/

P Please consider the environment before printing this email.
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