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Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

AW: NeoPeep

1 message

Purchasing <purchasing@dehas.de> 20 September 2022 at 12:17
To: kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Hi Kate,

 

thanks for your mail and price information.

 

Please see our PO attached.

 

Mit freundlichen Grüßen/with best regards

 

Christopher Kramp

Einkauf / Purchasing manager

 

***Achtung – neue Anschrift für Lieferscheine und Rechnungen***

 

Ab dem 08.08.2022 finden Sie uns unter unserer neuen Anschrift / Please note our new address:

 

DEHAS Medical Systems GmbH

Wesloer Straße 107-109

23568 Lübeck

+49 451 80 90 4 - 120 fon

+49 451 80 90 4 - 111 fax

www.DEHAS.de

Geschäftsführung DEHAS :  J. Mittendorf / HRB: 21902 HL / USt.-IdNr.:  DE348387794

Diese E-Mail kann vertrauliche und/oder rechtlich geschützte Informationen enthalten. Wenn Sie nicht der richtige Adressat sind oder diese E-Mail irrtümlich erhalten
haben, informieren Sie bitte sofort den Absender und vernichten Sie diese E-Mail. Das unerlaubte Kopieren sowie die unbefugte Weitergabe dieser E-Mail ist nicht
gestattet. 

This e-mail may contain confidential and/or privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient or have received this e-mail in error, please notify the sender
immediately and destroy this e-mail. Any unauthorised copying, disclosure or distribution of the material in this e-mail is strictly forbidden

 

 

Von: Main Account [mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com] Im Auftrag von Kate Griffiths

Gesendet: Montag, 5. September 2022 12:24


https://www.google.com/maps/search/Wesloer+Stra%C3%9Fe+107?entry=gmail&source=g
http://www.dehas.de/
mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com
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An: Purchasing <purchasing@dehas.de>; Ryan Swaine <ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk>

Betreff: Re: NeoPeep

 

Good morning Christopher,

 

Thank you for your email.

 

The items you purchased are as follows:

 

3210011 Neonatal resuscitation circuit with adjustable PEEP.  We also have part number 3210013 which is a box of 20,
this costs €104.80 each box.


3210070 Single Use Silicone Round Facemask - Size 0.   We also have part number 3210073 which is a box of 20, this
costs €59.20 each box  We also have part number 3210076 which is a box of 100, this costs €296 each box.

3210071 Single Use Silicone Round Facemask - Size 1.   We also have part number 3210074 which is a box of 20, this
costs €59.20 each box and part number 3210077 which is a box of 100, this costs £296 each box.


0120138 Straight Connector 15 I.D. - 15 I.D - box of 25           Not 20 boxes in stock

 

Please let me know if I can be of any further assistance.

 

Many thanks.

 

Kind regards

 

Kate Griffiths

 

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone calls
to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

 

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

 

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

 

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

 

E-mail Disclaimer

-----------------
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GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in
reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

 

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete
in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

-----------------

 

 

On Fri, 2 Sept 2022 at 07:49, Purchasing <purchasing@dehas.de> wrote:

Good morning Ryan,

 

we bought the attached articles as samples from your company and we’re now hitting the next step in the
project.

Tests with your equipment had been successful.

 

Do you have standard box or set sizes for those articles? I’d need a price for 20 pcs of each article – or is it the
same as the single prices you offered?

 

Kindly awaiting your feedback.

 

Mit freundlichen Grüßen/with best regards

 

Christopher Kramp

Einkauf / Purchasing manager

 

***Achtung – neue Anschrift für Lieferscheine und Rechnungen***

 

Ab dem 08.08.2022 finden Sie uns unter unserer neuen Anschrift / Please note our new address:

 

DEHAS Medical Systems GmbH

Wesloer Straße 107-109

23568 Lübeck

+49 451 80 90 4 - 120 fon

+49 451 80 90 4 - 111 fax

www.DEHAS.de

http://www.viamed.co.uk/policy
mailto:purchasing@dehas.de
https://www.google.com/maps/search/Wesloer+Stra%C3%9Fe+107?entry=gmail&source=g
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Geschäftsführung DEHAS :  J. Mittendorf / HRB: 21902 HL / USt.-IdNr.:  DE348387794

Diese E-Mail kann vertrauliche und/oder rechtlich geschützte Informationen enthalten. Wenn Sie nicht der richtige Adressat sind oder diese E-Mail irrtümlich erhalten
haben, informieren Sie bitte sofort den Absender und vernichten Sie diese E-Mail. Das unerlaubte Kopieren sowie die unbefugte Weitergabe dieser E-Mail ist nicht
gestattet. 

This e-mail may contain confidential and/or privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient or have received this e-mail in error, please notify the sender
immediately and destroy this e-mail. Any unauthorised copying, disclosure or distribution of the material in this e-mail is strictly forbidden

 

 

Von: Main Account [mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com] Im Auftrag von Ryan Swaine

Gesendet: Dienstag, 12. Juli 2022 15:50

An: Purchasing <purchasing@dehas.de>

Betreff: Re: NeoPeep

 

Dear Christopher

 

I apologise for the delay, there is some trouble supplying the adapters you have listed, as they are no longer CE
certified, but I have an alternative for you. Please find our distributor pricing below (for in stock items):

 

3210011 - Neopeep = EUR €7.00

3210070 - size 0 mask = EUR €3.15

3210067 - size 0.5 mask: not available from stock, pricing would have to be checked, a minimum order quantity
would have to be imposed

3210071 - size 1 mask = EUR €3.15

0120138 - 15mm-15mm adapter = EUR €22.25 / box of 25

 

Best regards

Ryan

 

 

 




Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager

VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk

Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542

Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy 

 

 

On Thu, 30 Jun 2022 at 12:36, Purchasing <purchasing@dehas.de> wrote:

Hi Ryan,
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I’d prefer Euro and for now it’s only 1 pcs each for testing, but if it turns out good there is more to come.

 

Mit freundlichen Grüßen/with best regards

 

Christopher Kramp

Einkauf / Purchasing manager

 

WE THINK PRESSURE & FLOW

 

DEHAS Medical Systems GmbH

Wesloer Straße 112

Gebäude M; 1.OG

23568 Lübeck

+49 451 80 90 4 - 120 fon

+49 451 80 90 4 - 111 fax

www.DEHAS.de

Geschäftsführung DEHAS :  J. Mittendorf / HRB: 21902 HL / USt.-IdNr.:  DE348387794

Diese E-Mail kann vertrauliche und/oder rechtlich geschützte Informationen enthalten. Wenn Sie nicht der richtige Adressat sind oder diese E-Mail irrtümlich
erhalten haben, informieren Sie bitte sofort den Absender und vernichten Sie diese E-Mail. Das unerlaubte Kopieren sowie die unbefugte Weitergabe dieser E-Mail
ist nicht gestattet. 

This e-mail may contain confidential and/or privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient or have received this e-mail in error, please notify the
sender immediately and destroy this e-mail. Any unauthorised copying, disclosure or distribution of the material in this e-mail is strictly forbidden

 

 

Von: Main Account [mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com] Im Auftrag von Ryan Swaine

Gesendet: Donnerstag, 30. Juni 2022 12:55

An: purchasing@dehas.de

Betreff: NeoPeep

 

Dear Christopher

 

Thank you very much for your email.

 

Please can you let me know if you prefer USD or EUR and what quantity you would require of each part?

 

Best regards

Ryan
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Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager

VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk

Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542

Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy 

 

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Purchasing <purchasing@dehas.de>

Date: Thu, 30 Jun 2022 at 10:41

Subject: Request

To: <info@viamed.co.uk>

 

Hi,

 

can you please give us an offer for the following items:

 

 

What’s the current lead time?

 

Thank you in advance!

 

Mit freundlichen Grüßen/with best regards

 

Christopher Kramp

Einkauf / Purchasing manager

 

WE THINK PRESSURE & FLOW

 

DEHAS Medical Systems GmbH

Wesloer Straße 112

Gebäude M; 1.OG

23568 Lübeck

http://www.viamed.co.uk/
mailto:ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
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+49 451 80 90 4 - 120 fon

+49 451 80 90 4 - 111 fax

www.DEHAS.de

Geschäftsführung DEHAS :  J. Mittendorf / HRB: 21902 HL / USt.-IdNr.:  DE348387794

Diese E-Mail kann vertrauliche und/oder rechtlich geschützte Informationen enthalten. Wenn Sie nicht der richtige Adressat sind oder diese E-Mail
irrtümlich erhalten haben, informieren Sie bitte sofort den Absender und vernichten Sie diese E-Mail. Das unerlaubte Kopieren sowie die unbefugte
Weitergabe dieser E-Mail ist nicht gestattet.

This e-mail may contain confidential and/or privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient or have received this e-mail in error, please
notify the sender immediately and destroy this e-mail. Any unauthorised copying, disclosure or distribution of the material in this e-mail is strictly
forbidden
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