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Michael Lamb <viamed.michael.lamb@gmail.com>

Fwd: Order for HARMONY - Dive Factory

1 message

Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> 20 September 2022 at 11:01
Reply-To: ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
To: Michael Lamb <michael.lamb@vandagraph.co.uk>

Ryan Swaine
General Manager

VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk

Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Seb -- Dive Factory <seb@divefactory.be>

Date: Mon, 19 Sept 2022 at 09:44

Subject: Order for HARMONY - Dive Factory

To: Ryan Swaine <ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk>


Dear Ryan,

By this I would like to place the following order:

6 X #7910201 TEK-OX + QUICK OX

6 X #0110217	 Sensor R-17VAN

Please invoice and deliver to:

Dive Factory by HARMONY SRL
chaussée de Tubize 475
B - 1420 Braine l’Alleud
Belgium

VAT BE0465.635.038

Do you still have our credit card details? If yes, you can charge it with the amount of the order. If not, please tell me.

Thank you very much!

Best regards,

Sebastian NICOLAY

Seb -- Dive Factory
seb@divefactory.be
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