20/09/2022, 11:21 Gmail - Fwd: Order ALR-ME-159 VIAMED

M Gma" Aqib Majeed <viamed.aqib.majeed@gmail.com>

Fwd: Order ALR-ME-159 VIAMED

Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> 20 September 2022 at 10:45
Reply-To: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk

To: Kate Giriffitths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>, Aqib Majeed <aqib.majeed@vmsecure.me.uk>, Sophie Lines
<sophie.lines@vmsecure.me.uk>

Hi, please process the order below.

Thank you, Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: HTS GmbH <kontakt@hts-trading.de>
Date: Tue, 20 Sept 2022 at 10:42

Subject: Order ALR-ME-159 VIAMED

To: <ryan.swaine@yviamed.co.uk>

Dear Ryan,
We are pleased to place an order for:

MAX250K Viasys R125P11-001 -5 pcs

MAX250A R125P04-001-10 pcs

Please note our NEW Invoice address from 01.09.2022:

HTS Elektrotechnik GmbH
Eresburgstr. 24-29
Gebaude 1, 1.0G

12103 Berlin

Our warehouse address is:

Lager HTS Elektrotechnik GmbH
AlboinstralRe 17-23

Halle 2
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Thank you very much in advance.

Best regards/ Mit freundlichen GriiRen

Irina Pinekenstein

HTS Elektrotechnik GmbH
Eresburgstr. 24-29

Gebéaude 1, 1.0G

12103 Berlin
Germany

kontakt@hts-trading.de
Tel: +49 (0)30 326-78-756

Tel: +49 (0)30 720-12-483
Fax: +49 (0)30 326-78-769

VAT-Nr.: DE 813950789
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