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Kind regards

Agib Majeed
Office Administrator

Viamed Ltd.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

email: agib.majeed@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

Please note: Viamed is enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office.
Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

E-mail Disclaimer

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in
reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Thu, 15 Sept 2022 at 13:46, Gilda Flores <gilda.flores@medix.com.ar> wrote:
Aqib,

Please check below full info for invoice address and delivery address:

Medix Medical Devices SRL
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Jean Mermoz 1750
El Talar, Tigre (B1618EWC)
Buenos Aires

Argentina

We wait, thank you!

&

MEDICAL DEVICES

mas Importante

Gilda Flores | Comprador Mercado Exterior
Gilda.flores@medix.com.ar

+54 11 5295-2747|

medix.com.ar

in]Ofw

Para conocer mas de nosotros presione aqui

De: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> En nombre de Agib Majeed
Enviado el: jueves, 15 de septiembre de 2022 09:34

Para: Gilda Flores <gilda.flores@medix.com.ar>

Asunto: Re: NEW QUOTATION- SOLPED 10439820 - VIAMED - OCI 3725

Hello
Can you please confirm full invoice address and | will amend it for you.
Also is the delivery address ok ?

Kind regards

Aqgib Majeed

Office Administrator
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