14/09/2022, 09:55 Gmail - Re: Order 10082284KG3 Tracking 1Z9W96386840975296

M Gma” Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Re: Order 10082284KG3 Tracking 1Z9W96386840975296

1 message

Steve Nixon <steve.nixon.viamed@googlemail.com> 14 September 2022 at 09:50
To: kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Please use GBP £57.75, after discussions with Bluepoint I'll update the price lists when | get back. NOTE: There are
currently delays due to component shortages.

Steve

On Tue, 13 Sept 2022, 16:54 Kate Giriffiths, <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Hi Steve,

Sorry to bother you.

| just wondered about pricing for Just Inc. He last purchased 10 x 0012721 in December 2021, they cost £57.75
each.

The special pricing on the memo is for the following only:

0014651 £50.00
0014752 £60.00
0014753 £60.00
0014754 £60.00
0014850 £60.00
0014851 £60.00
0014850 £60.00
0014895 £27.50
0014896 £32.50
SN 10/08/2022

If I go with distributor pricing, it is £76.50 this time (plus carriage). But his a/c automatically gives the price of
£110 (no carriage as end user).

Thank you for your help.
Kind regards
Kate Griffiths

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone
calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.
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