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Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Re: Request

1 message

Juan Manuel Rodriguez Velandia <operaciones@biosancta.com> 12 September 2022 at 15:05
To: kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Okay.

The quantity is 1 (one).

And the address is correct.

 

Bendiciones,

 Juan Manuel Rodriguez V
Coordinador Administrativo y Calidad

Tel. 601 5262071
- 601 4323126 - 601 5215207

 

operaciones@biosancta.com

www.biosancta.com

Usted
está recibiendo este correo electrónico por estar dentro de las bases
de datos registradas por BIOSANCTA
SAS, si ya no desea
recibir
más correos por parte de nosotros por favor responder con la
palabra STOP, al presente correo o manifestándolo al correo electrónico
habeasdata@biosancta.com

Este
mensaje puede contener información confidencial y/o de uso interno de la BIOSANCTA SAS, Si usted no es el destinatario, por favor
notifique de
forma inmediata al remitente, borre este mensaje y absténgase de
usarlo, copiarlo o divulgarlo. Los comentarios u opiniones no necesariamente
representan a la compañía.  

BIOSANCTA SAS, Dispone
de mecanismos que garantizan la protección, almacenamiento, y buen uso de sus
datos personales, Conozca nuestra política de protección
de datos personales,
usted puede ejercer su derecho a conocerlos o suprimirlos de acuerdo a lo
establecido en la Ley 1581 de 2012 escribiéndonos
al correo electrónico
habeasdata@biosancta.com
o informando al teléfono 57-1 4874131.

 


El lun, 12 sept 2022 a las 9:01, Kate Griffiths (<office@viamed.co.uk>) escribió:

Hi Juan,


Shipping is not included in the price of the item.  I can give you the shipping cost in the form of a proforma invoice,
this will also show insurance and bank charges. 


Please could you let me know how many you require?


Is the delivery address for the proforma invoice as follows?


BIOSANCTA

Carrera 16A No 162-37

Bogata

Columbia

162-37

South America



Many thanks.
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Kind regards


Kate Griffiths


Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone
calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.



http://www.viamed.co.uk
Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542
Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582


Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd


Company registered in England, No. 01291765.


E-mail Disclaimer
-----------------
GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.
If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken
in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.


If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542
-----------------




On Mon, 12 Sept 2022 at 14:31, Juan Manuel Rodriguez Velandia <operaciones@biosancta.com> wrote:


Good morning
Kate.

Ok, thank you
very much, a question in this value is already included the value of the
shipment to Colombia and if it is not, please can

you tell us what the cost of
the shipment would be.

Thanks.

 

Bendiciones,

 Juan Manuel Rodriguez V
Coordinador Administrativo y Calidad

Tel. 601 5262071
- 601 4323126 - 601 5215207

 

operaciones@biosancta.com

www.biosancta.com

Usted
está recibiendo este correo electrónico por estar dentro de las bases
de datos registradas por BIOSANCTA
SAS, si ya no desea
recibir
más correos por parte de nosotros por favor responder con la
palabra STOP, al presente correo o manifestándolo al correo electrónico
habeasdata@biosancta.com

Este
mensaje puede contener información confidencial y/o de uso interno de la BIOSANCTA SAS, Si usted no es el destinatario, por favor
notifique de forma inmediata al remitente, borre este mensaje y absténgase de
usarlo, copiarlo o divulgarlo. Los comentarios u opiniones no
necesariamente
representan a la compañía.  

BIOSANCTA SAS, Dispone
de mecanismos que garantizan la protección, almacenamiento, y buen uso de sus
datos personales, Conozca nuestra política de
protección de datos personales,
usted puede ejercer su derecho a conocerlos o suprimirlos de acuerdo a lo
establecido en la Ley 1581 de 2012 escribiéndonos
al correo electrónico habeasdata@biosancta.com
o informando al teléfono 57-1 4874131.
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El lun, 12 sept 2022 a las 4:31, Kate Griffiths (<office@viamed.co.uk>) escribió:


Good morning Juan,


Thank you for your enquiry.


Please accept my reply, Zoey is now on maternity leave.  Enquiries/orders can be accessed by all our
office team at orders@viamed.co.uk



We are able to supply the membrane for the V1000, our part number is 1430295, the price is $25 each EXW. 
This item is currently in stock.


Please let me know if you require a proforma invoice.


Many thanks.


Kind regards


Kate Griffiths


Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office.
Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.



http://www.viamed.co.uk
Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542
Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582


Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd


Company registered in England, No. 01291765.


E-mail Disclaimer
-----------------
GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.
If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be
taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.


If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply
with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542
-----------------




On Fri, 9 Sept 2022 at 21:19, Juan Manuel Rodriguez Velandia <operaciones@biosancta.com> wrote:


Good afternoon,
Zoe.

Please can you
help us by quoting a replacement membrane or front panel for a fetal simulator
equipment.

Thank you

Bendiciones,

 Juan Manuel Rodriguez V
Coordinador Administrativo y Calidad

Tel. 601 5262071
- 601 4323126 - 601 5215207

 

operaciones@biosancta.com

www.biosancta.com
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Usted
está recibiendo este correo electrónico por estar dentro de las bases
de datos registradas por BIOSANCTA
SAS, si ya no desea
recibir más correos por parte de nosotros por favor responder con la
palabra STOP, al presente correo o manifestándolo al correo
electrónico habeasdata@biosancta.com

Este
mensaje puede contener información confidencial y/o de uso interno de la BIOSANCTA SAS, Si usted no es el destinatario, por favor
notifique de forma inmediata al remitente, borre este mensaje y absténgase de
usarlo, copiarlo o divulgarlo. Los comentarios u opiniones no
necesariamente
representan a la compañía.  

BIOSANCTA SAS, Dispone
de mecanismos que garantizan la protección, almacenamiento, y buen uso de sus
datos personales, Conozca nuestra política
de protección de datos personales,
usted puede ejercer su derecho a conocerlos o suprimirlos de acuerdo a lo
establecido en la Ley 1581 de 2012
escribiéndonos
al correo electrónico habeasdata@biosancta.com
o informando al teléfono 57-1 4874131.
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