05/09/2022, 14:41 Gmail - Fwd: FSM3300

M Gma” Agib Majeed <viamed.agib.majeed@gmail.com>

Fwd: FSM3300

Steve Nixon <office@viamed.co.uk> 2 September 2022 at 12:21

Reply-To: steve.nixon@viamed.co.uk

To: office@vmsecure.me.uk

Cc: Cathy Green <cathy.green@viamed.co.uk>
Please use this as an order to process the following to:
Trionara Technologies AB.

Polygonvagen 21.
Taby 18766. Sweden.

1007 x 4330122 @ USD $5.96 each
Medical Digital Flow Meter
SENSIRION SFM3300-250-D
EXW

Trionara DHL account is 954 572 912.

Steve

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Alireza Yaghoubzadeh <alireza222@gmail.com>
Date: Tue, 30 Aug 2022 at 19:49

Subject: Re: FSM3300

To: <steve.nixon@viamed.co.uk>

Dear Steve

Itis ok
But please the account and address are changed

Our address is

Trionara Technologies AB.

Polygonvagen 21.

Taby 18766. Sweden.

Our DHL import account is 954 572 912. So you can send under our DHL account.

Best regards

Alireza

On Tue, Aug 23, 2022 at 15:14 Steve Nixon <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Dear Alireza
Yes of course we can ship the sensors to Trionara Technologies. Do you have an order number or reference to
quote, or should we just use the email to cover? Please let me know the contact person details: name, email,
phone number.
The pricing to clear everything so that we are both even is as follows:

$6,000/ 1,007 = $5.96 each EXW Viamed.

Do you agree for us to process and invoice out at USD $5.96 each EXW Viamed?
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The address you provided looks new, can you please advise the status of the following previous accounts:

EUR account
Trionara Technologies AB Laxfiskevagen 6, , Partille, , 43338, Sweden

USD account
Trionara Technologies AB - USD 7th Floor, Lilla Badhusgaten 2, Gothenburg, , 41121, Sweden

FYI further to discussions with Ali Noorali in May, we effectively 'wrote off' the balance in order to clear the
accounts.

For reference:
On Fri, 23 Jul 2021 at 09:07, Somerford <ali@somerfordelectronics.co.uk> wrote:

Dear Steve,
Please provide a proforma invoice for Trionara Technology for 1020 unit for $23755.80.

We will pay $17755.80 and the reminder will be paid from the sale of the unit and the rest of it being
credited to Trionara account.

The sale price is something you decide is reasonable to sell.

As regards to $693.24 of Mesa, they informed that they have paid, | am in process of getting a receipt.
Kind regards

Ali

So effectively (MVM131790 invoice) $23755.80 - payment of $17755.80 = $6,000.00

Kind regards
Steve
On Tue, 23 Aug 2022 at 12:25, Alireza Yaghoubzadeh <alireza222@gmail.com> wrote:
Dear Steve
Can you please send it by DHL to our office in Taby. Sweden.
Our DHL import account is 954 572 912.
Trionara Technologies AB.
Polygonvagen 21.
Taby 18766. Sweden.

Best regards
Alireza

On Tue, Aug 23, 2022 at 15:52 Steve Nixon <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Dear Alireza

It is good to hear from you. We still have the following, so if you can use them then it would be great.
Viamed part number 4330122

Medical Digital Flow Meter

SENSIRION SFM3300-250-D

Qty in stock: 1,007

Regards

Steve
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On Tue, 23 Aug 2022 at 12:04, Alireza Yaghoubzadeh <alireza222@gmail.com> wrote:
Dear Steve

| hope you are doing well, long time no see.
Did you manage to sell the FSM3300 which was ordered wrongly ?
Or still keep them?

If you didn’t sell, | believe we can use them in new project

Best regards
Alireza

Steve

Steve Nixon

Director - Viamed Ltd.
Office: +44 (0)1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0)7850 252267

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

Steve

Steve Nixon

Director - Viamed Ltd.
Office: +44 (0)1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0)7850 252267

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

Steve

Steve Nixon

Director - Viamed Ltd.
Office: +44 (0)1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0)7850 252267

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=07ddd72f30&view=pt&search=all&permmsgid=msg-f%3A1742856718618088301&simpl=msg-f%3A1742856... 3/3


mailto:alireza222@gmail.com
http://www.viamed.co.uk/policy
http://www.viamed.co.uk/policy
http://www.viamed.co.uk/policy

