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Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Re: Order 27042273ZT1 Tracking 2898611962

1 message

Sudath Weeraman <sudathweeraman17@gmail.com> 31 August 2022 at 02:55
To: kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Dear Kate,

Thanks for your reply, ok can you arrange 4 pcs R-42V & 20 Pcs MAX-250E Oxygen sensors? 
after settled previous pending payments..we hope it can be settled soon.

Regarding 15 Pcs R-24MED can offer within 2 weeks? Because my client requested only R-24MED

Anyway in future not possible to issue above R-24MED, we can explain to the client go for the R-49V

Thank you, 

Best Regards,

Sudath Weeraman 
Prime Lanka Associates 
Sri Lanka. 

On Tue, Aug 30, 2022, 5:43 PM Kate Griffiths <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Good afternoon Sudath,



Thank you for your email.



We currently have 4 x 0110042 - R-42V in stock currently.  The price is £34 each EXW.



We have plenty of stock currently of part number 0110429 - MAX-250E.  The price is £45.50 each EXW.



Regarding your payment for Invoice No. RVM138476-1 (GBP 597.84), I will look out for your payment via PayPal.



Regarding another order for 15 x R-24MED, 0110024, I cannot see an order on our system, so I assume this is a
future order?



We are expecting stock in approximately 1-2 weeks.   Part number 0110049 - R-49V is also out of stock, the
approximate lead time is 2-3 weeks.


I have started your order for 
5 x R-42V & 20 x MAX-250E.  Unless you prefer to order the four R-42V that we
have in stock?  I will confirm the order when payment has been received.



I have not started an order for 15 x R-24MED.


I hope I understand your requirements correctly.



Kind regards



Kate Griffiths



Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone
calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.
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