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Ryan Swaine <viamed.ryan.swaine@gmail.com>

Re: pro-forma invoice MAN124815

1 message

Gerald Loo <gerald@opstechnologies.com> 29 August 2022 at 02:47
To: ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk, Gail Bell <gail.bell@vandagraph.co.uk>
Cc: "tatiana@opstechnologies.com" <tatiana@opstechnologies.com>, "Gordon@opstechnologies.com"
<Gordon@opstechnologies.com>

Dear Ryan

Can I get a quote on
the lead time and courier charges of the following please:

1. 0110217 - R-17VAN O2
Sensor - 15pcs

2. 0110226 - R-33VAN O2 Sensor - 5pcs

Thank you.


Best Regards,


Gerald
Loo
/ Business Manager

/ Gerald@opstechnologies.com

CMP Technologies Pte Ltd / OPS Military (ASIA) Pte
Ltd
Office: (65)
63820060 / Fax: (65) 63826676


1 Ubi View #03-16 Focus One Singapore 408555


This e-mail
message may contain confidential or legally privileged
information and is intended only for the use of the intended
recipient(s).
Any unauthorized disclosure, dissemination,
distribution, copying or the taking of any action in reliance on
the information herein is
prohibited. E-mails are not secure and
cannot be guaranteed to be error free as they can be
intercepted, amended, or contain viruses.
Anyone who
communicates with us by e-mail is deemed to have accepted these
risks. Company Name is not responsible for errors or
omissions
in this message and denies any responsibility for any damage
arising from the use of e-mail. Any opinion and other statement
contained in this message and any attachment are solely those of
the author and do not necessarily represent those of the
company.

On 4/3/2021 6:49 pm, Ryan Swaine wrote:


Dear Gerald

Thank you very much for your order. Please find your
proforma invoice attached, we have the stock
available and we
can ship as soon as payment is made.

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk

Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Thu, 4 Mar 2021 at 06:41,
Gerald Loo <Gerald@opstechnologies.com>
wrote:
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Dear Ryan, 


We would like
to purchase the following:


1. 0110217 -
R-17VAN O2 Sensor - 14pcs

2. 0110226 - R-33VAN O2 Sensor - 12pcs



Could you please quote the lead time and courier charges
please?

Thank you. 


Best Regards,




Gerald Loo / Business Manager

/
Gerald@opstechnologies.com

CMP
Technologies Pte Ltd / OPS Military (ASIA) Pte Ltd
Office: (65) 63820060 / Fax: (65) 63826676 

1 Ubi View #03-16 Focus
One Singapore 408555


This
e-mail message may contain confidential or legally
privileged information and is intended only for the use
of the
intended recipient(s). Any unauthorized
disclosure, dissemination, distribution, copying or the
taking of any action in
reliance on the information
herein is prohibited. E-mails are not secure and cannot
be guaranteed to be error free as
they can be
intercepted, amended, or contain viruses. Anyone who
communicates with us by e-mail is deemed to have
accepted these risks. Company Name is not responsible
for errors or omissions in this message and denies any
responsibility for any damage arising from the use of
e-mail. Any opinion and other statement contained in
this message
and any attachment are solely those of the
author and do not necessarily represent those of the
company.

On 21/7/2020 4:55 pm, Ryan Swaine wrote:


Thank you Gerald




Ryan Swaine

VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117




On Tue, 21 Jul 2020 at
02:09, Gerald Loo <Gerald@opstechnologies.com>
wrote:


Hi
Ryan, 


Noted
on the shortfall, we will be sure to add it into
our it for our next order. 


Thank
you and apologies for the inconveniences caused.


Best Regards,




Gerald Loo /
Business
Manager

/
Gerald@opstechnologies.com
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CMP Technologies Pte Ltd
/ OPS Military (ASIA) Pte Ltd Office: (65) 63820060
/ Fax:
(65) 63826676


1 Ubi View
#03-16 Focus One Singapore 408555


This
e-mail message may contain confidential or
legally privileged information and is intended
only
for the use of the intended recipient(s).
Any unauthorized disclosure, dissemination,
distribution,
copying or the taking of any
action in reliance on the information herein is
prohibited. E-mails are not
secure and cannot be
guaranteed to be error free as they can be
intercepted, amended, or contain
viruses. Anyone
who communicates with us by e-mail is deemed to
have accepted these risks.
Company Name is not
responsible for errors or omissions in this
message and denies any
responsibility for any
damage arising from the use of e-mail. Any
opinion and other statement
contained in this
message and any attachment are solely those of
the author and do not necessarily
represent
those of the company.

On 20/7/2020 11:40 pm, Ryan Swaine wrote:


Dear Gerald


Thank you very much for your payment, we
received GBP £458.
Unfortunately there is a
shortfall of £12, please can you add this to
your
payment on your next order?


Best regards


Ryan




Ryan Swaine

VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk

Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117




On Mon, 20 Jul
2020 at 09:37, Gerald Loo
<Gerald@opstechnologies.com>
wrote:


Dear
Gail, 


We
have made the payment, please let us
know as soon as you get
a lead time on
our order. 


Thank
you. 


Best Regards,




Gerald Loo
/
Business
Manager

/
Gerald@opstechnologies.com

CMP Technologies Pte Ltd
/ OPS Military (ASIA) Pte Ltd Office:
(65)
63820060 / Fax:
(65)
63826676 

1 Ubi
View #03-16 Focus One Singapore 408555


This
e-mail message may contain confidential
or legally privileged information
and is
intended only for the use of the
intended recipient(s). Any unauthorized
disclosure, dissemination, distribution,
copying or the taking of any action in
reliance on the information herein is
prohibited. E-mails are not secure and
cannot be guaranteed to be error free as
they can be intercepted, amended, or
contain viruses. Anyone who communicates
with us by e-mail is deemed to have
accepted these risks. Company Name is
not responsible for errors or omissions
in this message and denies any
responsibility for any damage arising
from the
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use of e-mail. Any opinion and
other statement contained in this
message and
any attachment are solely
those of the author and do not
necessarily represent
those of the
company.

On 8/7/2020 10:32 pm, Gail Bell wrote:


Good afternoon Gerald,


Please find attached your proforma
invoice
MAN124815 for your approval
and payment.


Please check that all the details
are correct including
delivery
address.


Our payment details are on the
invoice or if you prefer
you can call
07803 907117 and provide credit card
details.


Once payment is received and we
replenish our stock
we will ship your
order.


Thank you very much for your time
and patience, we
really appreciate it,


Kind regards


Gail Bell
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk/
Email gail.bell@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel:  +44 (0)1535 634900
Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582


Company registered in
England, No. 02332105.
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If you are not the intended
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action taken or omitted to
be
taken in reliance on it, is
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If you feel you have
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or
would like to be removed
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