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Aqib Majeed <viamed.aqib.majeed@gmail.com>

Re: PROFORMA INVOICE MVM138319 - TACOM // BRAZIL


Vinicius Carmo <vinicius.carmo@tacom.com.br> 30 August 2022 at 14:51
To: aqib majeed <aqib.majeed@viamed.co.uk>
Cc: Vânia Cristina <cristina@tacom.com.br>, Compras <compras@tacom.com.br>

Hello Aqib, 

How are you?

We made the payment yesterday, please check your account. I will send you the SWIFT soon.

Please send the goods by our FEDEX account 796386118 to bellow address:

INSPIRAR  COMERCIO DE VENTILADORES PULMONARES LTD

PRAÇA PROFESSOR JULIO DOS SANTOS, 68 - BAIRRO VARGINHA - CITY ITAJUBÁ -
MINAS GERAIS - BRAZIL -ZIP CODE: 37501-098

ID/vat: 37.061.424/0002-57

Please, before you ship the goods, send me the  commercial invoice for checking.

Thanks and best regards,

Vinicius Carmo
Compras

Av. Raja Gabaglia, 3800   

Belo Horizonte - MG

+55 (31) 3348 1028

vinicius.carmo@tacom.com.br

www.tacom.com.br

Esta mensagem contém informação confidencial protegida por direitos de autor ou que pode conter direitos de propriedade intelectual. O uso
da marca TACOM sem consentimento prévio, por escrito, da TACOM PROJETO DE BILHETAGEM INTELIGENTE LTDA é proibido. Se, por
engano, receber esta mensagem, por favor apague a mesma e destrua todas as suas cópias. Sendo destinatário desta mensagem não deve
divulgá-la e distribui-la a terceiros, sem o consentimento da empresa. A nossa empresa não pode assegurar que a integridade desta
mensagem foi mantida, nem que a comunicação está livre da intercepção de vírus ou de interferências. Antes de imprimir, pense em seu compromisso com o

Meio Ambiente.

De: "Aqib Majeed" <office@viamed.co.uk>

Para: "Vinicius Carmo" <vinicius.carmo@tacom.com.br>

Enviadas: Terça-feira, 9 de agosto de 2022 12:05:11

Assunto: Re: PROFORMA INVOICE MVM138319 - TACOM // BRAZIL


Hello Vinicius 

Good afternoon

Please accept my reply on behalf of Zoey as she is on maternity leave. 

I have attached your proforma invoice below without the paypal charges as you required, Could
you please confirm if the delivery and invoice addresses are correct please.
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If you have any other enquiries please don't hesitate to ask.

Kind regards

Aqib Majeed

Office Administrator
Viamed Ltd.

http://www.viamed.co.uk
email: aqib.majeed@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542
Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582
Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer
-----------------
The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.
If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or
omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing
list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy 
-----------------

On Tue, 9 Aug 2022 at 15:39, Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:





---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk>

Date: Tue, 9 Aug 2022 at 13:16

Subject: Fwd: PROFORMA INVOICE MVM138319 - TACOM // BRAZIL

To: Cathy Green <cathy.green@vmsecure.me.uk>









---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Vinicius Carmo <vinicius.carmo@tacom.com.br>

Date: Tue, 9 Aug 2022 at 13:15

Subject: PROFORMA INVOICE MVM138319 - TACOM // BRAZIL

To: <orders@viamed.co.uk>

Cc: <zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk>, Compras <compras@tacom.com.br>





Hi dear Zoey, 


We will pay by wire because paypal is having problems, ok?



Could you please correct the invoice?
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Thanks and best regards,

Vinicius Carmo
Compras

Av. Raja Gabaglia, 3800   

Belo Horizonte - MG

+55 (31) 3348 1028

vinicius.carmo@tacom.com.br

www.tacom.com.br



Esta mensagem contém informação confidencial protegida por direitos de autor ou que pode conter direitos de propriedade intelectual. O
uso da marca TACOM sem consentimento prévio, por escrito, da TACOM PROJETO DE BILHETAGEM INTELIGENTE LTDA é proibido.
Se, por engano, receber esta mensagem, por favor apague a mesma e destrua todas as suas cópias. Sendo destinatário desta mensagem
não deve divulgá-la e distribui-la a terceiros, sem o consentimento da empresa. A nossa empresa não pode assegurar que a integridade
desta mensagem foi mantida, nem que a comunicação está livre da intercepção de vírus ou de interferências. Antes de imprimir, pense em seu

compromisso com o Meio Ambiente.
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