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Ryan Swaine <viamed.ryan.swaine@gmail.com>

NEW ORDER PURCHASE - 2022.28 - VANDAGRAPH

1 message

Iago - Totalmat <iago.jesus@totalmat.com.br> 23 August 2022 at 21:35
To: ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Cc: luc@totalmat.com.br

Hi Ryan,

 

My outstanding payments were made on August 15th as SWIFT attached.

 

I need you to send me 11 more O2 sensor units.

I will pay you 30 days after shipping.

 

You can ship by DHL.

My DHL account number 952383376.

FORMAL EXPORT

 

Can you ship to me by Thursday, August 25th?

 

Thanks.

 

 

 

VEJA O NOVO SITE DA TOTALMAT COM CATALOGO ONLINE  www.totalmat.com.br

SEE THE NEW TOTALMAT WEBSITE WITH ONLINE CATALOG www.totalmat.com

Iago de Jesus

Comercial/Vendas - Commercial / Sales

TOTALMAT Industria e Comercio de
Equipamentos Hiperbáricos Ltda 

 

Cell Phone: +55 (11) 99373-4683

Phone: +55 (11) 5524-3918

 

R Augusto Ferreira de Morais, 282 - Socorro
CEP: 04763-000, São Paulo/SP - Brasil
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iago.jesus@totalmat.com.br

IMCA member     

 

 

De: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> Em nome de Ryan Swaine

Enviada em: terça-feira, 2 de agosto de 2022 09:05

Para: Iago - Totalmat <iago.jesus@totalmat.com.br>

Cc: luc@totalmat.com.br

Assunto: Re: NEW ORDER PURCHASE - 2022.26 - VANDAGRAPH

 

Dear Iago

 

Please find a signed copy attached.

 

Best regards

Ryan

 

 

Ryan Swaine

General Manager

VANDAGRAPH Ltd.

http://www.vandagraph.co.uk

Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

 

 

On Mon, 1 Aug 2022 at 11:48, Iago - Totalmat <iago.jesus@totalmat.com.br> wrote:

Hi Ryan,

 

I need the Commercial Invoice and PAcking list signed

 

Thanks.
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SEE THE NEW TOTALMAT WEBSITE WITH ONLINE CATALOG www.totalmat.com
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TOTALMAT Industria e Comercio de
Equipamentos Hiperbáricos Ltda 

 

Cell Phone: +55 (11) 99373-4683

Phone: +55 (11) 5524-3918

 

R Augusto Ferreira de Morais, 282 - Socorro
CEP: 04763-000, São Paulo/SP - Brasil

iago.jesus@totalmat.com.br

IMCA member     

 

 

De: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> Em nome de Ryan Swaine

Enviada em: quarta-feira, 27 de julho de 2022 10:52

Para: Iago - Totalmat <iago.jesus@totalmat.com.br>

Assunto: Re: NEW ORDER PURCHASE - 2022.26 - VANDAGRAPH

 

Hi Iago

 

It is with our warehouse, but it is unlikely to go today, as we do not have a regular collection with DHL, only UPS. I
expect it will go out tomorrow.

 

Best regards

Ryan




Ryan Swaine

General Manager

VANDAGRAPH Ltd.

http://www.vandagraph.co.uk

Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

 

 

On Wed, 27 Jul 2022 at 12:42, Iago - Totalmat <iago.jesus@totalmat.com.br> wrote:

Hi Ryan,
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Send by DHL today please and send me the signed Invoice and Packing list.

 

Thanks.

 

VEJA O NOVO SITE DA TOTALMAT COM CATALOGO ONLINE  www.totalmat.com.br

SEE THE NEW TOTALMAT WEBSITE WITH ONLINE CATALOG www.totalmat.com

Iago de Jesus

Comercial/Vendas - Commercial / Sales

TOTALMAT Industria e Comercio de
Equipamentos Hiperbáricos Ltda 

 

Cell Phone: +55 (11) 99373-4683

Phone: +55 (11) 5524-3918

 

R Augusto Ferreira de Morais, 282 - Socorro
CEP: 04763-000, São Paulo/SP - Brasil

iago.jesus@totalmat.com.br

IMCA member     

 

 

De: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> Em nome de Ryan Swaine

Enviada em: quarta-feira, 27 de julho de 2022 07:14

Para: Iago - Totalmat <iago.jesus@totalmat.com.br>

Cc: Luc Vercammen <luc@totalmat.com.br>

Assunto: Re: NEW ORDER PURCHASE - 2022.26 - VANDAGRAPH

 

Hi Iago

 

Thank you very much, order confirmation attached.

 

I pay you for this purchase and the last one in 2 weeks - Perfect, thank you

 

Best regards

Ryan
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Ryan Swaine

General Manager

VANDAGRAPH Ltd.

http://www.vandagraph.co.uk

Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

 

 

On Tue, 26 Jul 2022 at 19:27, Iago - Totalmat <iago.jesus@totalmat.com.br> wrote:

Hi Ryan,

 

I need 10 more O2 sensors.

 

Can you please send by DHL.

My DHL account number 952383376.

I pay you for this purchase and the last one in 2 weeks

 

Thanks.

 

VEJA O NOVO SITE DA TOTALMAT COM CATALOGO ONLINE  www.totalmat.com.br

SEE THE NEW TOTALMAT WEBSITE WITH ONLINE CATALOG www.totalmat.com

Iago de Jesus

Comercial/Vendas - Commercial / Sales

TOTALMAT Industria e Comercio de
Equipamentos Hiperbáricos Ltda 

 

Cell Phone: +55 (11) 99373-4683

Phone: +55 (11) 5524-3918

 

R Augusto Ferreira de Morais, 282 - Socorro
CEP: 04763-000, São Paulo/SP - Brasil

iago.jesus@totalmat.com.br

IMCA member     
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2029791_Comprovante SWIFT_.pdf
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