22/08/2022, 16:32 Gmail - FW: Official Order 1391812

M Gma“ Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com>
FW: Official Order 1391812

1 message

HOPKINS, Thomas (TORBAY AND SOUTH DEVON NHS FOUNDATION TRUST) 22 August 2022 at
<thomas.hopkins2@nhs.net> 16:27

To: "viamedinbox@gmail.com" <viamedinbox@gmail.com>, "BRESLIN, Rachael (TORBAY AND SOUTH DEVON NHS
FOUNDATION TRUST)" <rachael.breslin@nhs.net>

Hi Sophie
Happy with pricing.
Please process the order.

Rachael — FYA new pricing.

Please note | no longer work Thursdays

Due to heavy demands on the Procurement Department and remote working, we may take longer than normal to
reply to emails and requests. We will reply to all emails in due course — Thank you for your patience.

Kind Regards

Tom

My working hours are —
Monday — Wednesday 08:00 to 18:00

Friday 08:00 to 17:30

Thomas Hopkins

Assistant Buyer-Clinical

Torbay and South Devon NHS Foundation Trust
01803 653364

INT: 53364

Procurement
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Ground Floor

Regent House
Regent Close
Torquay

Devon
TQ2 7AN

From: TSDFT.CPS (TORBAY AND SOUTH DEVON NHS FOUNDATION TRUST) <tsdft.cpos@nhs.net>

Sent: 22 August 2022 16:23

To: HOPKINS, Thomas (TORBAY AND SOUTH DEVON NHS FOUNDATION TRUST) <thomas.hopkins2@nhs.net>
Cc: TSDFT.CPS (TORBAY AND SOUTH DEVON NHS FOUNDATION TRUST) <tsdft.cps@nhs.net>

Subject: FW: Official Order 1391812

Hi Tom

Can you please review the below pricing increase for SCBU?

Many thanks
Kind Regards

Mandy

Amanda Capstick

Administrative Assistant — Clinical Procurement

Torbay and South Devon NHS Foundation Trust

Procurement | Regent House | Regent Close | Torquay TQ2 7AN

Direct Line: 01803 653302 |Internal: 53302 | Email: amanda.capstick@nhs.net

Working with you, for you

Please note, due to heavy demands on the Procurement Department and remote working, we may take longer than
normal to reply to emails and requests. We will reply to all emails in due course — Thank you for your patience.

From: TSDFT, Procurement (TORBAY AND SOUTH DEVON NHS FOUNDATION TRUST)
<procurement.tsdft@nhs.net>

Sent: 22 August 2022 15:40

To: TSDFT.CPS (TORBAY AND SOUTH DEVON NHS FOUNDATION TRUST) <tsdft.cps@nhs.net>
Subject: Fw: Official Order 1391812
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Hi Mandy
| think this is clinical. It's for babies

EyeMax Phototherapy Mask - Regular Eye Masks 1114005 (viamed.co.uk)

e EyeMax Phototherapy Mask - Regular Eye Masks
1114005 - Viamed

Viamed Ltd, established in 1977, has built a strong reputation for the design, manufacture and
distribution of a wide range of quality medical equipment; from pulse oximetry and oxygen
monitoring devices, used during patient monitoring, through to neonatal intensive care
equipment such as infant resuscitation and warming and phototherapy devices.

www.viamed.co.uk

Kind regards

Dave

Procurement Team

Please ensure that you direct your queries to the relevant department. See below list of department emails
that may be able to assist you:

Clinical Procurement tsdft.cps@nhs.net
Corporate Procurement procurement.tsdft@nhs.net
Invoice Payments payments.tsdft@nhs.net

Unit 4 systems team unit4admin.tsdft@nhs.net

Please note, due to heavy demands on the Procurement Department and reduced staffing levels, we may take longer
than normal to reply to emails and requests. We will reply to all emails in due course — Thank you for your patience.

Procurement Department|Ground Floor

Regents House| Regents Close| Torquay | Devon | TQ2 7AN

T: 01803 653365

E: Procurement.tsdft@nhs.net
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From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> on behalf of Sophie Lines <office@viamed.co.uk>
Sent: Monday, August 22, 2022 13:45

To: TSDFT, Procurement (TORBAY AND SOUTH DEVON NHS FOUNDATION TRUST)
<procurement.tsdft@nhs.net>

Subject: Re: Official Order 1391812

This message originated from outside of NHSmail. Please do not click links or open attachments unless you recognise the
sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Procurement,

Thank you for your order. Unfortunately the price on your order is incorrect.

The prices for the EyeMax Phototherapy Masks range have recently increased to the following:

1114005 - Regular (Blue) - Pack of 20 = £48.00
1114006 - Premie (Orange) - Pack of 20 = £46.00
1114007 - Micro (Green) - Pack of 20 = £42.00

EyeMax 2 Postage charges:

1 pack: £6.00
2 - 4 packs: £8.00
5+ packs: £10.00

Please can you let me know if you are happy for me to proceed with your order?

Kind regards
Sophie Lines
Please note: My working days are Monday, Tuesday and Friday

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone calls to the main office
will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

http://www.viamed.co.uk
Emailsophie.lines@viamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and
may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44
(0)1535 634542

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy
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On Mon, Aug 22, 2022 at 1:22 PM Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: SDHCT, Agradmin (TORBAY AND SOUTH DEVON NHS FOUNDATION TRUST) <agradmin.sdhct@nhs.net>
Date: Mon, 22 Aug 2022 at 13:14

Subject: Official Order 1391812

To: <orders@viamed.co.uk>

Please process the attachedorder.Kind Regards, TSDFT

Ak kA hkrhk bk ok hk ok h ok hkk Ak khkhhk ko hk kA ko k ko ko ko k ko ko hk ko hk ko k ko h ko hhkhk ko k Ak kA vk hkhkhkhkhkhkhkhkhhkhkhkhkhhkhhkhkrhkhhkhkhkhhkhkhxkhxk*x%x

dhhkhkhkkhkrkhkrkkhkhkhkhkhkhhkhhrkhkrkhkrkhkhkhkhkkxk*x

This message may contain confidential information. If you are not the intended
recipient please:

i) inform the sender that you have received the message in error before deleting it;
and

ii) do not disclose, copy or distribute information in this e-mail or take any action
in relation to its content (to do so is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful).
Thank you for your co-operation.

NHSmail is the secure email, collaboration and directory service available for all NHS
staff in England. NHSmail is approved for exchanging patient data and other sensitive

information with NHSmail and other accredited email services.

For more information and to find out how you can switch visit Joining NHSmail — NHSmail
Support
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