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M Gma” Janine Gill <viamed.janine.gill@gmail.com>
Viamed Pro forma MVM137999

8 messages

Janine Gill <janine.gill@viamed.co.uk> 20 July 2022 at 15:22

To: sales@vinyaselectronics.in
Hello
The pro forma sent to you on 4th July 22 will go out of date on 4.8.22.
If you require the parts please make payment and then these items can be dispatched out.
Please feel free to contact me if you need any other info.
Kind regards
Janine Gill
Office Administrator
Viamed Ltd.
http://www.viamed.co.uk
Email: janine.gill@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634 542
Fax: +44 (0)1535 635 582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in
reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542
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Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> 27 July 2022 at 14:57
To: Janine Gill <janine.gill@vmsecure.me.uk>

[Quoted text hidden]
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Janine Gill <janine.gill@viamed.co.uk> 27 July 2022 at 15:06
To: sales@vinyaselectronics.in

Hello

| have attached your proforma as it will expire on 4th Aug 22.
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Unfortunately, we do not send out free samples but if you would like 5 pieces sent | can send you another proforma
for 5 pieces. Once we receive payment for these | can then ship them to you.

If you would like to go ahead with this order we will need payment first. If you do not want to go ahead please let me
know so | can update our systems.

Kind regards

Janine Gill
Office Administrator
Viamed Ltd.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email: janine.gill@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634 542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635 582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in
reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542
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Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> 27 July 2022 at 15:22
To: Janine Gill <janine.gill@vmsecure.me.uk>

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: vinyas <sales@vinyaselectronics.in>

Date: Wed, 27 Jul 2022 at 15:09

Subject: FW: Viamed Pro forma MVM137999

To: lyyappan S <iyyappan@schillerindia.com>, <viamedinbox@gmail.com>

Hi Sir,

Pls share your details to Viamed, they will send PI at your name.

Regards

Rajkumar S

[Quoted text hidden]
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Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> 12 August 2022 at 09:16
Reply-To: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk

To: Kate Giriffitths <kate.griffiths@vmsecure.me.uk>, Sophie Lines <sophie.lines@vmsecure.me.uk>, Janine Gill
<janine.gill@vmsecure.me.uk>, Aqib Majeed <agib.majeed@vmsecure.me.uk>

Hi,

Please can we send Rajukumar a proforma invoice for 5x NOXO 100 (0110960) sensors.
Thank you, Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager

VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk

Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

—————————— Forwarded message ---------

From: vinyas <sales@vinyaselectronics.in>
Date: Fri, 12 Aug 2022 at 01:45

Subject: RE: FW: Viamed Pro forma MVM137999
To: <ryan.swaine@yviamed.co.uk>

Hi ryan,

We will release payment with Insurance by today.

And

NOXO 100 Sensors - pn. 0110960 - USD $181.90 each EXW : this is we have received repeat order. Pls consider
pricing at 148 USD. Need your support.

Approximate delivery schedule - 4-6 weeks.

Regards

Rajkumar S

Director

VINYAS ELECTRONICS

29C, Shiva Vishnu Avenue,

Kannivakkam, Chennai-603202, Tamilnadu, India.

Mobile: +91 9043890468
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Mail: Sales@vinyaselectronics.in

From: Main Account [mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com] On Behalf Of Ryan Swaine
Sent: 11 August 2022 22:26

To: Vinyas Electronics <sales@vinyaselectronics.in>

Subject: Re: FW: Viamed Pro forma MVM137999

Dear Rajikumar

Thank you for your email.

NOXO 100 Sensors - pn. 0110960 - USD $181.90 each EXW

Approximate delivery schedule - 4-6 weeks.

You do not need to have the insurance, but there would be no recourse if your goods were missing or damaged in
transit. Viamed would bear no responsibility.

Please let me know if you are happy to proceed and if so | will arrange to send you a proforma invoice?

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542

Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Thu, 11 Aug 2022 at 17:03, Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> wrote:

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: vinyas <sales@vinyaselectronics.in>
Date: Thu, 11 Aug 2022 at 17:00

Subject: FW: Viamed Pro forma MVM137999
To: <viamedinbox@gmail.com>
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Awaiting your input.

Regards

Rajkumar S

From: vinyas [mailto:sales@vinyaselectronics.in]

Sent: 11 August 2022 17:21

To: 'viamedinbox@gmail.com' <viamedinbox@gmail.com>
Subject: RE: Viamed Pro forma MVM137999

Hi Ryan,

Pls confirm how fast we can get this material? We are releasing payment by today. & Need NOX0100 - 5 pcs
pls support at old price

Pls waive of Insurance & re consider the fright. That’s huge.

Awaiting your revised PI to proceed further.

Regards

Rajkumar S

Director

VINYAS ELECTRONICS

29C, Shiva Vishnu Avenue,

Kannivakkam, Chennai-603202, Tamilnadu, India.
Mobile: +91 9043890468

Mail: Sales@vinyaselectronics.in

From: vinyas [mailto:sales@vinyaselectronics.in]

Sent: 27 July 2022 19:40

To: 'lyyappan S' <iyyappan@schillerindia.com>; viamedinbox@gmail.com

Subject: FW: Viamed Pro forma MVM137999
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Hi Sir,

Pls share your details to Viamed, they will send PI at your name.

Regards

Rajkumar S

From: Main Account [mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com] On Behalf Of Janine Gill
Sent: 27 July 2022 19:37

To: sales@vinyaselectronics.in

Subject: Re: Viamed Pro forma MVM137999

Hello

[Quoted text hidden]
[Quoted text hidden]

Kate Griffiths <office@viamed.co.uk> 12 August 2022 at 11:36

Reply-To: kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

To: Ryan Swaine <ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk>

Cc: Sophie Lines <sophie.lines@vmsecure.me.uk>, Janine Gill <janine.gill@vmsecure.me.uk>, Aqgib Majeed
<agib.majeed@vmsecure.me.uk>

done ©
Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone
calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in
reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

[Quoted text hidden]
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Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> 12 August 2022 at 11:45

Reply-To: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk

To: kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Cc: Sophie Lines <sophie.lines@vmsecure.me.uk>, Janine Gill <janine.gill@vmsecure.me.uk>, Aqgib Majeed
<aqib.majeed@vmsecure.me.uk>

Thank you very much

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

[Quoted text hidden]

vinyas <sales@vinyaselectronics.in> 18 August 2022 at 10:33

To: Janine Gill <office@yviamed.co.uk>, ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk

Hi Janine Gill,

Kindly regret delay in response, Pls share revised Pl to process the payment — Removing UPS charges.

USE FEdex account no: 681808515

Awaiting your immediate response to proceed further. | hope you are having stock-5 pcs.

Regards

Rajkumar S

Director

VINYAS ELECTRONICS

29C, Shiva Vishnu Avenue,

Kannivakkam, Chennai-603202, Tamilnadu, India.
Mobile: +91 9043890468

Mail: Sales@vinyaselectronics.in
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From: Main Account [mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com] On Behalf Of Janine Gill
Sent: 27 July 2022 19:37

To: sales@vinyaselectronics.in

Subject: Re: Viamed Pro forma MVM137999

Hello
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