15/08/2022, 14:03 Gmail - TRANSFER Viamed Pro forma

M Gma” Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com>
TRANSFER Viamed Pro forma

1 message

Edgar Cabello Sandoval <elecom12@hotmail.com> 9 August 2022 at 17:14

To: Janine Gill <office@viamed.co.uk>

HOLA,

ADJUNTO TRANSFERENCIA BANCARIA DE SENSORES

SALUDOS
EDGAR CABELLO
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Confirmacion v v ©

Opearacion raalizada & las 11:07:01 horas del 09 Ago 2022

Tu operscion de USD 2,549.86 de |z cusnts CUENTA PREMIER 4024991903
hecia ls cuenta VIAMED LTD GES2EUKE20784239771244 = reclizo
exitozaments.

Esta opsracion =a reslizars inmedistaments v no pusde cancelarse. Ezta
operacion se realizera inmedistamsents v no pusds cancslarss. Si tu operacion
cas an un dia inhabil, se realizars al siguisnts dia habil.

I Detalles de la operacion

D= México
CUENTA PREMIER
4024321203 | (2D

I FPara

Nombre dal VIAMED LTD
beneficiario

Paiz del bensficiaric UNITED KINGDOM

Direccion del 15 STATION ROAD CROSS HILLS KEIGHLEY

benaficiario WEST YORSHIRE BED20 7DT UMNITED
KINGDOM

Tipo de codigo SWIFT

bancaric

Momero de cuenta del GB32BUKEB20784289771244
beneficiario

Nombre del banco del BARCLAYS BANK PLC
beneficiario

Codigo del banco del BUKBGB22
beneficiario

Psis del banco del UNITED KINGDOM
beneficiario

Direccion del banco 1 CHURCHILL PLACE LONDOMN E14 SHP
dal beneficiario

I Detalles de la operacion

Tipo de ocperacion Tranafarencia a una cuenta de otro banco
internacional

Monto depositado E=) 2549 .68

Comisiones Pagar todos los cargos
Monto retirado 3 52584.54

Tipo de cambio 1.00 USD = 206162947 MXN

I Detalles de referencia

Maotivo de la Pago de factura o compra
opsracion

Comentariocs SENSOR R21 A

Concepto MVM128155

Folio 98615

Fecha S Ago 2022

De: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> en nombre de Janine Gill <office@viamed.co.uk>
Enviado: miércoles, 27 de julio de 2022 08:45 a. m.

Para: elecom12@hotmail.com <elecom12@hotmail.com>

Asunto: Re: Viamed Pro forma
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Hello

| recently sent you a proforma for 100 x Oxygen sensors.

Please let me know if you would like to go ahead with this purchase as the quote will expire on 12th Aug 22.
We will need payment before the order is dispatched if you wish to go ahead.

| have attached the proforma for reference and if you need any other info please feel free to contact me.
Kind regards

Janine Gill

Office Administrator

Viamed Ltd.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email: janine.gill@viamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634 542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635 582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.
E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in
reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Wed, 13 Jul 2022 at 10:11, Janine Gill <janine.qgill@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Hello Edgar

Thank you for your email.

Please find the Pro Forma requested attached for 100 x R-22A Sensors.
This pro forma includes delivery, please be aware the goods will not be sent out until payment has been made.
Could you also please check the address on the pro forma is correct
Please feel free to contact me if you need any other information.

Kind regards

Janine Gill

Office Administrator

Viamed Ltd.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email: janine.gill@viamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634 542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635 582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.
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E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken
in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542
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