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Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Request for Quote - MX300

1 message

Lucky Goyal <lucky.goyal@medviceglobal.com>
To: "kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk" <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>

Hi Kate, Thanks for your prompt response.

 

Could you please send me a Proforma Invoice. Please find below the details:

Downtown, 5th Floor, Standard Chartered Tower Building,

Sheikh Zayed Road, Near Burj Khalifa, Opposite Emaar Square

P.O. Box 35482, Dubai, United Arab Emirates

 

Also, Please confirm if the Part # quoted and requested are same.

 

 

Regards,

Lucky Goyal

Corporate Operations

MEDVICE SOLUTIONS, LLC

Downtown, 5th Floor, Standard Chartered Tower Building,

Sheikh Zayed Road, Near Burj Khalifa, Opposite Emaar Square

P.O. Box 35482, Dubai, United Arab Emirates

www.medviceglobal.com

Contact :971-503-956-152

Email-
lucky.goyal@medviceglobal.com 

 

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of
Kate Griffiths

Sent: 10 August 2022 18:29

To: Lucky Goyal <lucky.goyal@medviceglobal.com>

Subject: Re: Request for Quote - MX300

 

Good afternoon Lucky,

 

Thank you for your enquiry.
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The price breaks for oxygen sensors are as follows:

 

0110041 - R-41V:

 

1 = $ 63.50 2 = $ 57.15 each EXW 3 -10= $ 53.98 each EXW 11 or more = $ 50.80 each EX

 

0110017 - R-17MED:

 

1 = $ 63.50 2 = $ 57.15  each EXW 3 - 10 = $ 53.98  each EXW 11 or more = $ 50.80  each E

 

Please note we are no longer able to supply the MX300 or AX300.

 

The sensors above are currently in stock.

 

If you require a proforma invoice detailing carriage charges, insurance and bank charges, I would need your invoice and d
up a new account for you.

 

Many thanks.

 

Kind regards

 

Kate Griffiths

 

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone calls t
answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

 

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

 

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

 

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.
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E-mail Disclaimer

-----------------

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at
www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in relia
be unlawful.

 

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete i
(0)1535 634542

-----------------

 

 

On Tue, 9 Aug 2022 at 19:09, Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

 

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Lucky Goyal <lucky.goyal@medviceglobal.com>

Date: Tue, 9 Aug 2022 at 17:20

Subject: Request for Quote - MX300

To: sales@viamed.co.uk <sales@viamed.co.uk>,
orders@viamed.co.uk <orders@viamed.co.uk>,
enquiries@viamed.c

 

Hi Team Viamed,

 

Greetings From Medvice!!

 

We are looking to source the following:

 

OEM Modality Model Part Number Part Name

FLUKE Test Equipments VT305
110041    Oxygen Sensor



R-41V

TELEDYNE ALANYTICAL INSTRUMENTS Test Equipments MX300
5.714.046 Oxygen Sensor


(Class R-17 MED)

 

Request you to quote for the same and let us know the availability and Lead Time.

 

Regards,

Lucky Goyal

Director – Corporate Operations
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MEDVICE SOLUTIONS, LLC

Downtown, 5th Floor, Standard Chartered Tower Building,

Sheikh Zayed Road, Near Burj Khalifa, Opposite Emaar Square

P.O. Box 35482, Dubai, United Arab Emirates

www.medviceglobal.com

Contact :971-503-956-152

Email-
lucky.goyal@medviceglobal.com 
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