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Ryan Swaine <viamed.ryan.swaine@gmail.com>

AW: NRC / Vandagraph Sensor R33DE

1 message

Andrea Krieger <krieger@nrc-international.com> 10 August 2022 at 08:36
To: "ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk" <ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk>

Good Morning

Ryan- I understand- can you please send the 30 pieces urgently?

And the 20 in backorder?

 

Mit freundlichen Grüßen / With kind Regards

Andrea Krieger

 

NRC International GmbH

Karlstr. 21 A

51702 Bergneustadt

Germany

Tel.: 0049 - 2261 500414

www.nrc-international.com

 

Wir würden uns über Ihr Feedback freuen. Veröffentlichen Sie doch eine Rezension in unserem Google-Profil.

NRC International GmbH would love your feedback. Post a review to our profile.

https://g.page/r/CTwirh_sl7bNEAo/review

 

Von: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> Im Auftrag von
Ryan Swaine
Gesendet: Dienstag, 9. August 2022 16:50

An: Andrea Krieger <krieger@nrc-international.com>

Betreff: Re: NRC / Vandagraph Sensor R33DE

 

Hi Andrea

 

I am sorry I have not got back to you sooner.

 

The price is the same, but I am waiting for delivery schedules from a component manufacturer before I can commit to
supplying 50 pieces straight away, we can definitely put 30 together for you. 
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Best regards

Ryan

 

Ryan Swaine

General Manager

VANDAGRAPH Ltd.

http://www.vandagraph.co.uk

Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

 

 

On Mon, 8 Aug 2022 at 09:17, Andrea Krieger <krieger@nrc-international.com> wrote:

Good Morning Ryan

This will be great, thank you very much, so please send me an offer for 50 pieces if possible.

And the estimated delivery time will be appreciated as well. We are running out today by this sensor so it will be
needed very soon.

Thank you very much

 

Mit freundlichen Grüßen / With kind Regards

Andrea Krieger

 

NRC International GmbH

Karlstr. 21 A

51702 Bergneustadt

Germany

Tel.: 0049 - 2261 500414

www.nrc-international.com

 

Wir würden uns über Ihr Feedback freuen. Veröffentlichen Sie doch eine Rezension in unserem Google-
Profil.

NRC International GmbH would love your feedback. Post a review to our profile.

https://g.page/r/CTwirh_sl7bNEAo/review
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Von: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com>
Im Auftrag von Ryan Swaine

Gesendet: Freitag, 5. August 2022 14:23

An: Andrea Krieger <krieger@nrc-international.com>

Betreff: Re: NRC / Vandagraph Sensor R33DE

 

Hi Andrea

 

We are going to have to increase the price soon, but we can accept the current pricing of GBP £29.75 each EXW,
for the time being.

 

Please let me know if you are happy to proceed?

 

Best regards

Ryan

 




Ryan Swaine

General Manager

VANDAGRAPH Ltd.

http://www.vandagraph.co.uk

Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

 

 

On Fri, 5 Aug 2022 at 09:16, Andrea Krieger <krieger@nrc-international.com> wrote:

 

Good Morning Ryan

Hope you are fine- can I get another offer, like the attached one, for 30 Sensors.

Will the price be the same?

Mit freundlichen Grüßen / With kind Regards

Andrea Krieger

 

NRC International GmbH

Karlstr. 21 A

51702 Bergneustadt

Germany

Tel.: 0049 - 2261 500414

www.nrc-international.com
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Wir würden uns über Ihr Feedback freuen. Veröffentlichen Sie doch eine Rezension in unserem Google-
Profil.

NRC International GmbH would love your feedback. Post a review to our profile.

https://g.page/r/CTwirh_sl7bNEAo/review

 

Von:
viamed.ryan.swaine@gmail.com <viamed.ryan.swaine@gmail.com>
Im Auftrag von Ryan Swaine

Gesendet: Montag, 20. Februar 2017 13:22

An: Andrea Krieger <krieger@nrc-international.com>

Betreff: Re: NRC / Vandagraph Sensor R33DE

 

Hi Andrea

 

I am very well, thank you. I hope you are too.

 

Thank you very much for your order.

 

I apologise that the bags were not closed on your previous order, I will speak with my colleagues and we will
make sure that they checked before dispatch.

 

Your sensors have gone in to production, please find your proforma invoice attached.

 

Best regards

 

Ryan

 

 

 




Ryan Swaine

VANDAGRAPH Ltd.

http://www.vandagraph.co.uk

Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

 

On 20 February 2017 at 11:21, Andrea Krieger <krieger@nrc-international.com> wrote:

Dear Ryan
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Hope you are fine.

I like to place an order about 30 Sensors D40- will you please send me the Invoice.

And please do me a favour. Last time all bags were open- will you please inform your colleague that he or
she will take care that the bags
are really closed.

 

Thank you in advance

Kind Regards

Andrea

 

NRC International GmbH

Stentenberg Str. 63

51702 Bergneustadt

Germany

Tel.: 0049 - 2261 500414

www.nrc-international.com

 

 

 

Von:
viamed.ryan.swaine@gmail.com [mailto:viamed.ryan.swaine@gmail.com]
Im Auftrag von Ryan
Swaine

Gesendet: Donnerstag, 8. Dezember 2016 12:43

An: Andrea Krieger

Betreff: Re: NRC / Vandagraph Sensor R33DE

 

Dear Andrea

 

I am very well, thank you. I hope you are too.

 

Thank you very much for your order, your sensors are with our engineer and should be ready by Monday, at
the latest (hopefully tomorrow).

 

Please find your proforma invoice attached.

 

Best regards

 

Ryan
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Ryan Swaine

VANDAGRAPH Ltd.

http://www.vandagraph.co.uk

Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

 

On 8 December 2016 at 10:36, Andrea Krieger <krieger@nrc-international.com> wrote:

Hello Ryan

 

Hope you are fine- i need 30 pieces from the cell D40. Will you please send me the invoice so I will take care
that you may get the payment
in a short time.

Kind Regards

Andrea

 

NRC International GmbH

Stentenberg Str. 63

51702 Bergneustadt

Germany

Tel.: 0049 - 2261 500414

www.nrc-international.com

 

 

 

Von:
viamed.ryan.swaine@gmail.com [mailto:viamed.ryan.swaine@gmail.com]
Im Auftrag von Ryan
Swaine

Gesendet: Freitag, 4. November 2016 10:37

An: Andrea Krieger

Betreff: Re: NRC / Vandagraph Sensor R33DE

 

Hi Andrea

 

The sensors have a date code at the end of the serial number, it appears as a letter and a number:

 

A2 = January 2012
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F5 = June 2015

 

Please note that the date code relates to the manufacturing date of the sensor component and this does not
have any bearing on your warranty. The warranty is 12 months from date
of invoice.

 

Best regards

 

Ryan

 

 

 

 




Ryan Swaine

VANDAGRAPH Ltd.

http://www.vandagraph.co.uk

Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

 

On 4 November 2016 at 09:24, Andrea Krieger <krieger@nrc-international.com> wrote:

 

 

Hello Ryan

 

Hope you are fine- can you please let me know how i can see how old the cell is? Where can I find the
production week or some other information
on the cell?

 

Kind Regards

Andrea

 

Von: Andrea Krieger


Gesendet: Donnerstag, 23. Juni 2016 11:14

An: 'viamed.ryan.swaine@gmail.com'

Betreff: AW: NRC / Vandagraph Sensor R33DE

 

 

Dear Ryan
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We like to get the first delivery about 25 pieces, will this be possible in a few days?

Kind Regards

Andrea

 

NRC International GmbH

Stentenberg Str. 63

51702 Bergneustadt

Germany

Tel.: 0049 - 2261 500414

www.nrc-international.com

 

 

 

 

 

Von:
viamed.ryan.swaine@gmail.com [mailto:viamed.ryan.swaine@gmail.com]
Im Auftrag von Ryan
Swaine

Gesendet: Donnerstag, 16. Juni 2016 14:42

An: Dirk Göldner <dirk@nrc-international.com>

Cc: Jean Lamb <jean@vandagraph.co.uk>

Betreff: Re: NRC / Vandagraph Sensor R33DE

 

Dear Dirk

 

It was nice to speak to you today. 

 

Further to our conversation, please find a proforma invoice attached. Please note that the pricing is in GBP
and I have applied the discount as promised. I have quoted for UPS on
our account, but please let me know if
you would prefer to make your own transport arrangements.

 

We would ask that your first couple of orders are prepaid, but we can look towards a credit account thereafter.
With regards to stock, we may have to split the first order, depending
on when you require them, in order
maintain our current obligations. However, if you have regular requirements then we can make sure in the
future that we have stock available and ready for immediate shipping.

 

I look forward to your response and please let me know if you have any questions.

 

Best regards
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Ryan

 

 

 

 

 




Ryan Swaine

VANDAGRAPH Ltd.

http://www.vandagraph.co.uk

Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

 

On 15 June 2016 at 10:21, Dirk Göldner <dirk@nrc-international.com> wrote:

To whom it may concern

 

We like to introduce ourselves as a well known company which is working in the Nitrox Diving scene for
more than a decade worldwide.

As well in reselling nitrox equipment and sensors. So we would like to ask you to do business with you and
reselling the sensor R33DE.

Do you have a pricelist or would you please make us an offer about 50 piece from this sensor R33DE.

We prefer to order 50 pieces at each time, because we are able to sell 400-500 pieces per each year.

If you have any questions or require something do not hesitate to contact me again.

 

Hoping to hearing from you soon.

Kind Regards

Dirk Göldner

 

NRC International GmbH

Stentenberg Str. 63

51702 Bergneustadt

Germany

Tel.: 0049 - 2261 500414

www.nrc-international.com
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