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Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

RE: Quotation

1 message

Divya Chandran <divya@navigamedical.com> 10 August 2022 at 08:22
To: "kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk" <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>
Cc: "ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk" <ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk>

Dear Kate,

 

Please send the PI urgently and try to arrange dispatch by tomorrow.

We will do the payment today as soon as we receive the PI.

 

Regards,

 

Divya Sharma

Product Specialist

Mob        :  +973 – 33629448

Tel:          :  +973 - 17112344

Fax:          :  +973 – 17583324

Web:       :
www.navigamedical.com

 

 

 

 

From: Divya Chandran


Sent: Wednesday, August 10, 2022 10:13 AM

To: kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Cc: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk

Subject: RE: Quotation

 

Hello Kate,

 

We have an urgent requirement for R-23V OXYGEN SENSOR-10 QTY.
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Please send us PI asap and make sure HS CODE NO: 90330000 is mentioned in the invoice.

Waiting to hear from you at the earliest.

 

Regards,

 

Divya Sharma

Product Specialist

Mob        :  +973 – 33629448

Tel:          :  +973 - 17112344

Fax:          :  +973 – 17583324

Web:       :
www.navigamedical.com

 

 

 

 

From: Main Account [mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com]
On Behalf Of Kate Griffiths
Sent: Wednesday, June 22, 2022 1:01 PM

To: Divya Chandran <divya@navigamedical.com>

Subject: Re: Quotation

 

Good morning Divya,

 

Thank you for your payment.  We will ship as soon as possible and email a tracking number as soon as the goods
leave our warehouse.

Kind regards

 

Kate Griffiths

 

Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin staff to work from home,
and I am now working remotely. Telephone calls to the main office will be answered remotely, but please
continue to use email where
possible.

 

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542
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