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Dive Now Whangarei <info@divenow.nz> 9 August 2022 at 02:30
Reply-To: info@divenow.nz
To: sales@vandagraph.co.uk

Hi Team,

Can you please confirm for me what cell this is?  It's for an Analox EII and I am after two cells please.  Shipping to
New Zealand

Thanks
Simon


Dive Now 
41 Clyde Street
Whangarei
0110

p 09 438 1075

www.divenow.nz 

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Simon Collins <simongsxr@gmail.com>

Date: Tue, Aug 9, 2022 at 1:21 PM

Subject: 

To: <info@divenow.co.nz>


https://www.google.com/maps/search/41+Clyde+Street+Whangarei+0110?entry=gmail&source=g
https://www.google.com/maps/search/41+Clyde+Street+Whangarei+0110?entry=gmail&source=g
http://www.divenow.nz/
mailto:simongsxr@gmail.com
mailto:info@divenow.co.nz


09/08/2022, 09:33 Gmail - Fwd:

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=7e81c75fe0&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f%3A1740645194902026404%7Cmsg-f%3A1740645194… 2/3

Ryan Swaine <ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk> 9 August 2022 at 09:26
Draft To: info@divenow.nz

Hi Simon

Thank you very much for your email. 
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As you have a dive centre, we would be happy to provide you with our trade pricing. 

The sensors you need are the R-33DE, they are GBP £35 each and we have them available from stock. 

2x R-33DE = GBP £70
Airmail = GBP £16
Total = GBP £86

We accept payment by bank transfer or most major debit/credit cards, if you would like to proceed with an order,
please let me know which you would prefer.

Best regards
Ryan

Ryan Swaine
General Manager

VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk

Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

[Quoted text hidden]
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