7/29/22, 1:19 PM Gmail - Fwd: MAX-250(B) Oxygen Sensor

M Gma” Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Fwd: MAX-250(B) Oxygen Sensor

1 message

Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> 29 July 2022 at 12:24
Reply-To: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk

To: Kate Giriffitths <kate.griffiths@vmsecure.me.uk>, Sophie Lines <sophie.lines@vmsecure.me.uk>, Agib Majeed
<aqib.majeed@vmsecure.me.uk>, Janine Gill <janine.gill@vmsecure.me.uk>

Hi, please process the order/proforma invoice.

Thank you, Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Turca lulia - Medical Corp <service@medicalcorp.ro>
Date: Fri, 29 Jul 2022 at 12:00

Subject: RE: MAX-250(B) Oxygen Sensor
To: <ryan.swaine@yviamed.co.uk>

Hello,

We accept the price offer for the Oxygen Sensor MAX-250(B) - 0110432 = EUR €58.80. And we want to place the
order for him.

Can you send me proforma invoice?

| waiting to your answer! Thank you!

Cu respect/Best regards,
Ing. Turca lulia
Bioinginer Medical
Tel: 0725 219 646

Medical Corp SRL
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MedicalCorp

v spiritul medicinel. Din 1998

Romania, 550165 Sibiu, Str. Ghe. Lazar nr. 8
(004)0269.232.673 ; +0269.245.532; +0369.447.835; int 13
www.medicalcorp.ro www.medicalshop.ro

office@medicalcorp.ro

Importator aparatura medicala: monitoare pacient, electrocardiografe, holter EKG, ecografe, spirometre,
audiometre, aparate aerosoli, oftalmoscoape, defibrilatoare, autoclave, electrocautere, concentratoare oxigen,
echipamente de urgenta, hartie pentru EKG si pentru printer-ul de la ecograf, cabluri, consumabile, etc.

Service pentru orice tip de echipament medical.

(RO) Acest e-mail a fost transmis de catre Medical Corp SRL. Informatiile din acest mesaj sunt confidentiale si pot fi protejate prin lege.
Prezentul mesaj este transmis in atentia exclusiva a destinatarului, accesul oricarei alte persoane fiind interzis. In situatia in care nu sunteti
destinatarul acestui mesaj, orice dezvaluire, copiere, distribuire a sa, precum si orice actiune sau inactiune decisa in baza sa este interzisa si
poate incalca legea. Daca ati primit acest mesaj din cauza unei erori, va rugam sa anuntati imediat expeditorul si sa stergeti mesajul din
sistemul dumneavoastra.

(EN) This email has been sent from Medical Corp SRL. The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged. It is intended
solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized. If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying,
distribution nor any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful. If you have received this message in
error, please notify the sender immediately, and delete this email from your system.

Before printing this document, think about the environment!

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Ryan Swaine
Sent: Wednesday, July 20, 2022 11:57 AM

To: service@medicalcorp.ro

Subject: Re: MAX-250(B) Oxygen Sensor

Dear Ing. Turca lulia

Thank you very much for your email.

Please find our distributor pricing below:

MAX-250(B) - 0110432 = EUR €58.80

Please let me know if you have any questions.
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Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Turca lulia - Medical Corp <service@medicalcorp.ro>
Date: Wed, 20 Jul 2022 at 07:59

Subject: MAX-250(B) Oxygen Sensor

To: <info@viamed-eu.com>

Hello,

| am a biomedical engineer at Medical Corp Romania.

Can you send me a price offer for the MAX-250(B) Oxygen Sensor (Part number — 0110432, GTIN / EAN13
5051826002971)?

| waiting to your answer! Thank you!

Cu respect/Best regards,
Ing. Turca lulia
Bioinginer Medical
Tel: 0725 219 646

Medical Corp SRL

MedicalCorp
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www.medicalcorp.ro www.medicalshop.ro
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Importator aparatura medicala: monitoare pacient, electrocardiografe, holter EKG, ecografe, spirometre,
audiometre, aparate aerosoli, oftalmoscoape, defibrilatoare, autoclave, electrocautere, concentratoare oxigen,
echipamente de urgenta, hartie pentru EKG si pentru printer-ul de la ecograf, cabluri, consumabile, etc.

Service pentru orice tip de echipament medical.

(RO) Acest e-mail a fost transmis de catre Medical Corp SRL. Informatiile din acest mesaj sunt confidentiale si pot fi protejate prin lege.
Prezentul mesaj este transmis in atentia exclusiva a destinatarului, accesul oricarei alte persoane fiind interzis. In situatia in care nu sunteti
destinatarul acestui mesaj, orice dezvaluire, copiere, distribuire a sa, precum si orice actiune sau inactiune decisa in baza sa este interzisa
si poate incalca legea. Daca ati primit acest mesaj din cauza unei erori, va rugam sa anuntati imediat expeditorul si sa stergeti mesajul din
sistemul dumneavoastra.

(EN) This email has been sent from Medical Corp SRL. The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged. It is
intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized. If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure,
copying, distribution nor any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful. If you have received this
message in error, please notify the sender immediately, and delete this email from your system.

Before printing this document, think about the environment!

Steve

Steve Nixon

Director - Viamed Ltd.

Office: +44 (0)1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0)7850 252267

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy
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