
7/25/22, 5:26 PM Gmail - Re: Quote for 2 of R-17MED, part number 0110017

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=b5871a5be0&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f%3A1739330914470221360%7Cmsg-f%3A173934142… 1/4

Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Re: Quote for 2 of R-17MED, part number 0110017

1 message

Richard Gammons <richard.gammons@york.ac.uk> 25 July 2022 at 17:07
To: kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Thanks Kate,

Yes we would like to buy the items, Although can she ring this number 01904 324477, as it’s my colleague Katy who
currently has the credit card for our research group.

Many thanks

Richard

On Mon, 25 Jul 2022 at 17:03, Kate Griffiths <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

Hi Richard,


As you are happy with the proforma invoice, I will turn it to a confirmed order, and will ask my colleague Cathy
Green to ring you tomorrow on 01904324549 to take payment.


Many thanks.


Kind regards


Kate Griffiths


Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin staff to work from home,
and I am now working remotely. Telephone calls to the main office will be answered remotely, but please
continue to use email where possible.
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On Mon, 25 Jul 2022 at 16:53, Richard Gammons <richard.gammons@york.ac.uk> wrote:


Thanks for updating the address Kate, 


We need to pay for these items with a credit card, how do we do that?


Many thanks,


Richard

------------------------------------------------------------
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