
7/25/22, 3:48 PM Gmail - Re: Quote for 2 of R-17MED, part number 0110017

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=b5871a5be0&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f%3A1739330914470221360%7Cmsg-f%3A173933518… 1/2

Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Re: Quote for 2 of R-17MED, part number 0110017

1 message

Richard Gammons <richard.gammons@york.ac.uk> 25 July 2022 at 15:27
To: kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Oh and they have also asked for a payment link?

------------------------------------------------------------
Dr R Gammons MChem PGCE PhD RSciTech AMRSC
Green Chemistry Research Technician
Department of Chemistry
University of York
YO10 5DD
Telephone: 01904 324549

Email disclaimer

On Mon, 25 Jul 2022 at 15:26, Richard Gammons <richard.gammons@york.ac.uk> wrote:

Thanks Kate, 


I have passed this onto our admin team to create purchase order,


The only thing I would change is the delivery address is "Department of Chemistry Stores" as thats where all of our
chemicals/consumables get delivered too, 


Cheers


Richard

------------------------------------------------------------
Dr R Gammons MChem PGCE PhD RSciTech AMRSC
Green Chemistry Research Technician
Department of Chemistry
University of York
YO10 5DD
Telephone: 01904 324549


Email disclaimer







On Mon, 25 Jul 2022 at 15:01, Kate Griffiths <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:


Good afternoon Richard,


Thank you for your email.


Please see attached proforma invoice - I have used this format instead of a quotation as your account is a
proforma account, but I can easily change it to a quotation if you prefer.
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