21/07/2022, 14:42 Gmail - Fwd: Purchase Order 5219339

M Gma” Janine Gill <viamed.janine.gill@gmail.com>
Fwd: Purchase Order 5219339
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Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> 21 July 2022 at 14:05

To: Janine Gill <janine.gill@vmsecure.me.uk>

—————————— Forwarded message ---------

From: <rgh-tr.directpurchase@nhs.net>

Date: Thu, 21 Jul 2022 at 14:00

Subject: Purchase Order 5219339

To: <orders@viamed.co.uk>

Cc: <rgh-tr.directpurchase@nhs.net>, <judith.farrow@nhs.net>

Please find attached a copy of our Purchase Order. The person named on the document should be advised of the
delivery date by return. Your delivery note and invoice should clearly state the purchase order number for prompt
payment. NHS terms and conditions apply unless otherwise agreed in writing. Regards, The Rotherham NHS
Foundation Trust

This message may contain confidential information. If you are not the intended recipient please:

i) inform the sender that you have received the message in error before deleting it; and

ii) do not disclose, copy or distribute information in this e-mail or take any action in relation to its content (to do so is
strictly prohibited and may be unlawful).

Thank you for your co-operation.

NHSmail is the secure email, collaboration and directory service available for all NHS staff in England. NHSmail is
approved for exchanging patient data and other sensitive information with NHSmail and other accredited email
services.

For more information and to find out how you can switch visit Joining NHSmail — NHSmail
Support<https://support.nhs.net/article-categories/joining-nhsmail/>

ﬂ po01a_2_ 244715.pdf
122K

Janine Gill <janine.gill@viamed.co.uk> 21 July 2022 at 14:33

To: judith.farrow@nhs.net
Hello
Thank you for your order.
| have noticed the prices you have are slightly different from ours at Viamed.
The price for part number 1114006 is £41.90 for each pack.
If you could kindly amend your PO and send it to me | will process your order.
Kind regards
Janine Gill
Office Administrator
Viamed Ltd.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=6321039d91&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f%3A1738967607953386346&simpl=msg-f%3A173896...

13


mailto:rgh-tr.directpurchase@nhs.net
mailto:orders@viamed.co.uk
mailto:rgh-tr.directpurchase@nhs.net
mailto:judith.farrow@nhs.net
https://support.nhs.net/article-categories/joining-nhsmail/
https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ui=2&ik=6321039d91&view=att&th=18220dd373f8eb6a&attid=0.1&disp=attd&realattid=18220dc6e13f31dfc381&safe=1&zw
http://www.viamed.co.uk/

21/07/2022, 14:42 Gmail - Fwd: Purchase Order 5219339

Email: janine.gill@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634 542
Fax: +44 (0)1535 635 582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in
reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

[Quoted text hidden]

FARROW, Judith (THE ROTHERHAM NHS FOUNDATION TRUST) <judith.farrow@nhs.net> 21 July 2022 at 14:36

To: Janine Gill <office@viamed.co.uk>
Cc: Procurement2 <rgh-tr.procurement2@nhs.net>

Hi

If you could kindly proceed with the order and | will ask procurement to amend the price for future
orders.

Thanks

Judith Farrow
Ward Clerk

Special Care Baby Unit

Rotherham Nhs Foundation Trust
Moorgate Road
Rotherham

S60 2UD

Telephone: 01709 424488
Internal Extension 4488

Email: Judith.farrow@nhs.net

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> on behalf of Janine Gill <office@viamed.co.uk>
Sent: 21 July 2022 14:33

To: FARROW, Judith (THE ROTHERHAM NHS FOUNDATION TRUST) <judith.farrow@nhs.net>
Subject: Re: Purchase Order 5219339
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This message originated from outside of NHSmail. Please do not click links or open attachments unless you recognise the
sender and know the content is safe.
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