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Zoey Teal <viamed.zoey.teal@gmail.com>

RE: Order 2022-01 for automotive oxygen sensors R-22AV


Tomáš Vacek <tomas.vacek@vshumpolec.cz> Tue, Jul 19, 2022 at 1:45 PM
To: zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk

Dear Zoey,

 

Can you please change the order to 25 pieces of R-22AV ?

 

Thank you.

Kind regards

 

Tomas Vacek

Jana Zabrany 37, Humpolec, Czech Republic

tomas.vacek@vshumpolec.cz

www.vshumpolec.cz

+420 602 441 332

 

 

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Zoey Teal

Sent: Tuesday, July 19, 2022 2:18 PM

To: Tomáš Vacek <tomas.vacek@vshumpolec.cz>

Subject: Re: Order 2022-01 for automotive oxygen sensors R-22A

 

Dear Tomas, 

 

Thank you for your email. 

 

Unfortunately we are unable to ship via the EU office at present. The EU office is for accreditation and registration
purposes only. 

 

Are you happy for me to proceed with your proforma? 


 

If you have any further queries, please do not hesitate to contact me.

 

Kind regards
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Zoey Teal

Please note: My working days are Monday to Thursday, 7.45am-6.00pm.

We are currently working remotely however telephone calls to the main office will still be
answered.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email: zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk

Alternate email: viamed.zoey.teal@gmail.com

Tel:  +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

 

Sign up to our mailing list, go to www.viamed.co.uk/sign-up 

 

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: facebook.com/ViamedLtdUK

 

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

 

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy 

-----------------

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken
in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

 

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

-----------------

 

 

On Tue, Jul 19, 2022 at 1:05 PM Tomáš Vacek <tomas.vacek@vshumpolec.cz> wrote:

Dear Zoey,

 

I am ordering 25 pieces of automotive oxygen sensors R-22A (price 26.30 USD/piece).
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But can you please send and invoice it by your EU branch office this time ? (if possible)

 

Please add some economy shipment as always (PPUPS6 Courier delivery – Standard).

 

Invoicing address as always :

 

Tomas Vacek

Jana Zabrany 37

396 01 Humpolec

Czech Republic

VAT: CZ7512161492

 

Thank you in advance.

Best regards

 

Tomas Vacek

Jana Zabrany 37, 39601 Humpolec, Czech Republic

tomas.vacek@vshumpolec.cz

www.vshumpolec.cz

+420 602 441 332
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