15/07/2022, 15:48 Gmail - RE: R218P12 PC/ 220173

M Gma” Ryan Swaine <viamed.ryan.swaine@gmail.com>

RE: R218P12 PC/ 220173

1 message

Nadia Gémez <nadia.gomez@sorevan.com> 14 July 2022 at 07:31
To: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Cc: PEDIDOS <pedidos@sorevan.com>

Thank you Ryan,

Let’s try in this occasion with DHL ROAD and let’s see.

Thanks for your support

Member of ﬁTH’:’!h'ﬂ T_ Nadia Gémez

Dpto. administracion / Backoffice

SOREVAN

MEDICAL SOREVAN, SL
C/ Puerta de Abajo, 18. Pol. Ind. Alpedrete - 28430 Alpedrete (Madrid)
TIf: (+34) 91 850 10 58 - Fax: (+34) 918 514 824

nadia.gomez@sorevan.com - WWWw.sorevan.com
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De: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> En nombre de Ryan Swaine
Enviado el: miércoles, 13 de julio de 2022 18:05

Para: Nadia Gémez <nadia.gomez@sorevan.com>

Asunto: Re: R218P12 PC/ 220173
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Hi Nadia

DHL Road transport would be approx EUR €59 or by DHL Alr approx €83.05. The risk would be your responsibility,
but we can arrange it if you wish?

| will await your reply.

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542

Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Wed, 13 Jul 2022 at 13:31, Nadia Gomez <nadia.gomez@sorevan.com> wrote:

Dear Ryan,

Pls find attached a new order.

On the other hand, the costs you use to charge by sending with UPS initially seems quite reasonable, that is the
reason we accept it but | am checking and all UPS goods we are receiving from the UK we need to change to
another customs agent as UPS does not deal with medical devices at customs; then just only to change to this
second customs agents | am seeing is 60-80 Euros... then if you have any other alternative different from UPS pls

use it, and thank you so much in advance for it; if not, we can also pickup with our forwarder (not cheap @)

If you have any comment or suggestion pls let me know.

Best Regards,

Member of Lo TIMANT _ Nadia Gémez

Dpto. administracion / Backoffice
SOREVAN  eocausorevan st
C/ Puerta de Abajo, 18. Pol. Ind. Alpedrete - 28430 Alpedrete (Madrid)

TIf: (+34) 91 850 10 58 - Fax: (+34) 918 514 824
nadia.gomez@sorevan.com - WwWw.sorevan.com
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De: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> En nombre de Ryan Swaine
Enviado el: martes, 12 de julio de 2022 15:54

Para: Nadia Gomez <nadia.gomez@sorevan.com>

Asunto: Re: R218P12

Hi Nadia

Thank you for your email.

The Handi+ are available from stock.

Handi+ - p/n 0111250 = EUR €133 each EXW

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542

Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Tue, 12 Jul 2022 at 14:26, Nadia Gomez <nadia.gomez@sorevan.com> wrote:

Dear Ryan, Sarah
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| need to quote 4x R218P12 ANALIZADOR OXIGENO Handi+ OXIMETRO from Maxtec...
Can you pls let me know if you have it in Stock and what would be our price.

Thank you in advance,

Kind Regards

Member of ﬁ TIMANT Nadia Gémez
Dpto. administracion / Backoffice

SDH EVAN MEDICAL SOREVAN, SL

C/ Puerta de Abajo, 18. Pol. Ind. Alpedrete - 28430 Alpedrete (Madrid)
TIf: (+34) 91 850 10 58 - Fax: (+34) 918 514 824
nadia.gomez@sorevan.com - Www.sorevan.com
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