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Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Fwd: NeoPeep
1 message

Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> 13 July 2022 at 09:21
Reply-To: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
To: Kate Griffitths <kate.griffiths@vmsecure.me.uk>, Zoey Teal <zoey.teal@vmsecure.me.uk>, Sophie Lines
<sophie.lines@vmsecure.me.uk>, Janine Gill <janine.gill@vmsecure.me.uk>, Aqib Majeed
<aqib.majeed@vmsecure.me.uk>

Hi, please set up an account and send them a proforma invoice for the following items:

1x 3210011 - Neopeep = EUR €7.00

1x 3210070 - size 0 mask = EUR €3.15

1x 3210071 - size 1 mask = EUR €3.15

1x 0120138 - 15mm-15mm adapter = EUR €22.25 / box of 25

Thank you, Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager

VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk

Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542

Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy 


---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Purchasing <purchasing@dehas.de>

Date: Wed, 13 Jul 2022 at 06:29

Subject: AW: NeoPeep

To: <ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk>


Good morning Ryan,

 

thanks for your mail and prices.

 

Can we order one of each article as a sample to see if it fits with our device?

You can leave out the 0.5 mask if it’s not available at the moment.

 

I’d really appreciate. Thanks in advance!

 

http://www.viamed.co.uk/
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http://www.viamed.co.uk/policy
mailto:purchasing@dehas.de
mailto:ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
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Mit freundlichen Grüßen/with best regards

 

Christopher Kramp

Einkauf / Purchasing manager

 

***Wir ziehen um***

 

Ab dem 08.08.2022 finden Sie uns unter unserer neuen Anschrift:

DEHAS Medical Systems GmbH

Wesloer Straße 107-109

23568 Lübeck

 

Am 08.08.2022 sind wir aufgrund des Umzuges nur bedingt telefonisch bzw. per Mail erreichbar

 

 

DEHAS Medical Systems GmbH

Wesloer Straße 112

Gebäude M; 1.OG

23568 Lübeck

+49 451 80 90 4 - 120 fon

+49 451 80 90 4 - 111 fax

www.DEHAS.de

Geschäftsführung DEHAS :  J. Mittendorf / HRB: 21902 HL / USt.-IdNr.:  DE348387794

Diese E-Mail kann vertrauliche und/oder rechtlich geschützte Informationen enthalten. Wenn Sie nicht der richtige Adressat sind oder diese E-Mail irrtümlich erhalten
haben, informieren Sie bitte sofort den Absender und vernichten Sie diese E-Mail. Das unerlaubte Kopieren sowie die unbefugte Weitergabe dieser E-Mail ist nicht
gestattet. 

This e-mail may contain confidential and/or privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient or have received this e-mail in error, please notify the sender
immediately and destroy this e-mail. Any unauthorised copying, disclosure or distribution of the material in this e-mail is strictly forbidden

 

 

Von: Main Account [mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com] Im Auftrag von Ryan Swaine

Gesendet: Dienstag, 12. Juli 2022 15:50

An: Purchasing <purchasing@dehas.de>

Betreff: Re: NeoPeep

 

Dear Christopher

 

I apologise for the delay, there is some trouble supplying the adapters you have listed, as they are no longer CE
certified, but I have an alternative for you. Please find our distributor pricing below (for in stock items):

https://www.google.com/maps/search/Wesloer+Stra%C3%9Fe+107?entry=gmail&source=g
https://www.google.com/maps/search/Wesloer+Stra%C3%9Fe+112?entry=gmail&source=g
http://www.dehas.de/
mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com
mailto:purchasing@dehas.de
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3210011 - Neopeep = EUR €7.00

3210070 - size 0 mask = EUR €3.15

3210067 - size 0.5 mask: not available from stock, pricing would have to be checked, a minimum order quantity would
have to be imposed

3210071 - size 1 mask = EUR €3.15

0120138 - 15mm-15mm adapter = EUR €22.25 / box of 25

 

Best regards

Ryan

 

 

 

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager

VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk

Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542

Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy 

 

 

On Thu, 30 Jun 2022 at 12:36, Purchasing <purchasing@dehas.de> wrote:

Hi Ryan,

 

I’d prefer Euro and for now it’s only 1 pcs each for testing, but if it turns out good there is more to come.

 

Mit freundlichen Grüßen/with best regards

 

Christopher Kramp

Einkauf / Purchasing manager

 

WE THINK PRESSURE & FLOW

 

DEHAS Medical Systems GmbH

Wesloer Straße 112

Gebäude M; 1.OG

http://www.viamed.co.uk/
mailto:ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
http://www.viamed.co.uk/policy
mailto:purchasing@dehas.de
https://www.google.com/maps/search/Wesloer+Stra%C3%9Fe+112?entry=gmail&source=g
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23568 Lübeck

+49 451 80 90 4 - 120 fon

+49 451 80 90 4 - 111 fax

www.DEHAS.de

Geschäftsführung DEHAS :  J. Mittendorf / HRB: 21902 HL / USt.-IdNr.:  DE348387794

Diese E-Mail kann vertrauliche und/oder rechtlich geschützte Informationen enthalten. Wenn Sie nicht der richtige Adressat sind oder diese E-Mail irrtümlich
erhalten haben, informieren Sie bitte sofort den Absender und vernichten Sie diese E-Mail. Das unerlaubte Kopieren sowie die unbefugte Weitergabe dieser E-Mail
ist nicht gestattet. 

This e-mail may contain confidential and/or privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient or have received this e-mail in error, please notify the
sender immediately and destroy this e-mail. Any unauthorised copying, disclosure or distribution of the material in this e-mail is strictly forbidden

 

 

Von: Main Account [mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com] Im Auftrag von Ryan Swaine

Gesendet: Donnerstag, 30. Juni 2022 12:55

An: purchasing@dehas.de

Betreff: NeoPeep

 

Dear Christopher

 

Thank you very much for your email.

 

Please can you let me know if you prefer USD or EUR and what quantity you would require of each part?

 

Best regards

Ryan

 




Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager

VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk

Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542

Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy 

 

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Purchasing <purchasing@dehas.de>

Date: Thu, 30 Jun 2022 at 10:41

Subject: Request

To: <info@viamed.co.uk>

 

Hi,

 

http://www.dehas.de/
mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com
mailto:purchasing@dehas.de
http://www.viamed.co.uk/
mailto:ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
http://www.viamed.co.uk/policy
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can you please give us an offer for the following items:

 

 

What’s the current lead time?

 

Thank you in advance!

 

Mit freundlichen Grüßen/with best regards

 

Christopher Kramp

Einkauf / Purchasing manager

 

WE THINK PRESSURE & FLOW

 

DEHAS Medical Systems GmbH

Wesloer Straße 112

Gebäude M; 1.OG

23568 Lübeck

+49 451 80 90 4 - 120 fon

+49 451 80 90 4 - 111 fax

www.DEHAS.de

Geschäftsführung DEHAS :  J. Mittendorf / HRB: 21902 HL / USt.-IdNr.:  DE348387794

Diese E-Mail kann vertrauliche und/oder rechtlich geschützte Informationen enthalten. Wenn Sie nicht der richtige Adressat sind oder diese E-Mail
irrtümlich erhalten haben, informieren Sie bitte sofort den Absender und vernichten Sie diese E-Mail. Das unerlaubte Kopieren sowie die unbefugte
Weitergabe dieser E-Mail ist nicht gestattet.

This e-mail may contain confidential and/or privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient or have received this e-mail in error, please
notify the sender immediately and destroy this e-mail. Any unauthorised copying, disclosure or distribution of the material in this e-mail is strictly
forbidden

 

 

https://www.google.com/maps/search/Wesloer+Stra%C3%9Fe+112?entry=gmail&source=g
http://www.dehas.de/

