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Sophie Lines <viamed.sophie.lines@gmail.com>

Fwd: QUOTE R21-A
1 message

Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> Tue, Jul 12, 2022 at 11:27 AM
Reply-To: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
To: Kate Griffitths <kate.griffiths@vmsecure.me.uk>, Zoey Teal <zoey.teal@vmsecure.me.uk>, Sophie Lines
<sophie.lines@vmsecure.me.uk>, Janine Gill <janine.gill@vmsecure.me.uk>, Aqib Majeed
<aqib.majeed@vmsecure.me.uk>

Hi, please can we set up an account and send Edgar a proforma invoice for 100x R-22A sensors (USD Distributor
pricing)

Thank you, Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager

VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk

Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542

Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy 


---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Edgar Cabello Sandoval <elecom12@hotmail.com>

Date: Mon, 11 Jul 2022 at 18:17

Subject: Re: QUOTE R21-A

To: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk <ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk>


MY NAME IS REGISTERED AS A COMPANY.

Address for invoice:
EDGAR CABELLO SANDOVAL                 
VIOLETA 84-B
C.P. 16070 CDMX
MEXICO
 

Address for delivery:

EDGAR CABELLO SANDOVAL

CAMELIA 12 - A
XALTOCAN C.P. 16090
XOCHIMILCO
CDMX MEXICO
TEL.
55 5489 9449


De: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> en nombre de Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk>

Enviado: lunes, 11 de julio de 2022 11:18 a. m.

Para: Edgar Cabello Sandoval <elecom12@hotmail.com>

Asunto: Re: QUOTE R21-A
 
Hi Edgar, please can you help me with the following questions:

Do we need a post code / zip code for the delivery address?
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Is the delivery address residential or should we add a company name?

Best regards
Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager

VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk

Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542

Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at
www.viamed.co.uk/policy 


On Mon, 11 Jul 2022 at 16:59, Edgar Cabello Sandoval <elecom12@hotmail.com> wrote:

OK, RYAN




SALUDOS

EDGAR



De: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> en nombre
de Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk>

Enviado: lunes, 11 de julio de 2022 04:27 a. m.

Para: Edgar Cabello Sandoval <elecom12@hotmail.com>

Asunto: Re: QUOTE R21-A
 
Dear Edgar


Thank you. Please can you confirm the following details:


Address for invoice:
EDGAR CABELLO SANDOVAL
VIOLETA 84-B
16070 CDMX
MEXICO
 


Address for delivery:

EDGAR CABELLO SANDOVAL

CAMELIA 12 - A
XALTOCAN C.P. 16090
XOCHIMILCO
CDMX MEXICO
TEL. 55 5489 9449





Do we need a post code / zip code for the delivery address?
Is the delivery address residential or should we add a company name?


We will await your reply.


Best regards
Ryan


Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager

VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk

Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542

Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

http://www.viamed.co.uk/
https://mail.google.com/mail/?view=cm&fs=1&tf=1&to=ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
http://www.viamed.co.uk/policy
https://mail.google.com/mail/?view=cm&fs=1&tf=1&to=elecom12@hotmail.com
https://mail.google.com/mail/?view=cm&fs=1&tf=1&to=viamedinbox@gmail.com
https://mail.google.com/mail/?view=cm&fs=1&tf=1&to=office@viamed.co.uk
https://mail.google.com/mail/?view=cm&fs=1&tf=1&to=elecom12@hotmail.com
http://www.viamed.co.uk/
https://mail.google.com/mail/?view=cm&fs=1&tf=1&to=ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk


12/07/2022, 13:11 Gmail - Fwd: QUOTE R21-A

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=d104de5290&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f%3A1738142293604430284%7Cmsg-f%3A173814229… 3/5

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at
www.viamed.co.uk/policy 





On Fri, 8 Jul 2022 at 19:32, Edgar Cabello Sandoval <elecom12@hotmail.com> wrote:


HI RYAN,



CAN YOU SEND ME PROFORMA FOR 100 PIECES,
AND DATA FOR BANK TRANSFER





SHIP TO :

EDGAR CABELLO SANDOVAL

CAMELIA 12 - A
XALTOCAN C.P. 16090
XOCHIMILCO
CDMX MEXICO


TEL. 55 5489 9449







SALUDOS

EDGAR CABELLO SANDOVAL








De: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> en nombre de Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk>

Enviado: viernes, 8 de julio de 2022 10:00 a. m.

Para: Edgar Cabello Sandoval <elecom12@hotmail.com>

Asunto: Re: QUOTE R21-A
 
Dear Edgar


I apologise for the delay in my reply.


We would be happy to extend to you our distributor pricing:


R-21A - p/n 0110121 - USD price per sensor EXW
USD Distributor 1+ = $ 32.90 
10+ = $ 28.20 
25+ = $ 26.30 
50+ = $ 24.70 
100+ = $ 23.20


I look forward to your response and any questions you may have.


Best regards
Ryan




Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager

VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk

Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542

Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at
www.viamed.co.uk/policy 





On Tue, 5 Jul 2022 at 01:01, Edgar Cabello Sandoval <elecom12@hotmail.com> wrote:


HI RYAN,
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Gas analysers .     Exhaust or flue gas analyzers.




WE ARE ASSEMBLERS OF VERIFICATION EQUIPMENT IN MEXICO














SALUDOS

EDGAR CABELLO SANDOVAL








De: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> en nombre de Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk>

Enviado: lunes, 4 de julio de 2022 05:58 a. m.

Para: elecom12@hotmail.com <elecom12@hotmail.com>

Asunto: Re: QUOTE R21-A
 
Dear Edgar


Thank you very much for your email.
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Before we quote you, please can you let me know the nature of your business?


Best regards
Ryan




Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager

VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk

Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542

Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at
www.viamed.co.uk/policy 



On Mon, 4 Jul 2022 at 08:17, Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:






---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Edgar Cabello Sandoval <elecom12@hotmail.com>

Date: Fri, 1 Jul 2022 at 18:26

Subject: QUOTE R21-A

To: sales@viamed.co.uk <sales@viamed.co.uk>






 

HELLO,

 

YOU COULD QUOTE ME 50 OXYGEN SENSORS MODEL R21-A.

 

 

THANKS.

 

EDGAR CABELLO SANDOVAL

COMPRAS

VIOLETA 84-B

16070 CDMX

MEXICO

 

Enviado desde Correo para Windows 10
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