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Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Re: Oxygen sensor

1 message

Kate Griffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk> 8 July 2022 at 08:37
Reply-To: kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
To: Director@avens.ae

Good morning Syed,

Thank you for your email.

The prices are as follows:


Part Number: OOM103 for Hamilton G5    R-22MEDV, part number 0110021 (single) $37.75 each EXW or 0110071
(matched pair) $75.50 each EXW

 

Part Number: OOM102-1   R-17Vi, part number 0110019 $32.50 each EXW

 


Part number: R125P01-009   MAX-250 with O ring, part number 0110425 $69 each EXW

Maquet Servo I Ventilator#6640044:   We do not have a suitable replacement

 

Hamilton T1 Ventilator ,P/N:396200:   We do not have a suitable replacement

Hamilton Medical 396008 O2 sensor:   R-48V, part number 0110048  $40 each EXW


I will start a proforma invoice and email you as soon as possible.

The addresses I have are as follows:

Avens Medical Supplies, Office No.1507,  SIT Tower, Dubai Silicon Oasis, Dubai, UAE   


Many thanks.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin staff to work from home,
and I am now working remotely. Telephone calls to the main office will be answered remotely, but please
continue to use email where possible.


http://www.viamed.co.uk
Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542
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On Fri, 8 Jul 2022 at 08:07, Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:





---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Syed Ali <Director@avens.ae>

Date: Thu, 7 Jul 2022 at 14:17

Subject: Oxygen sensor

To: zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk <zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk>, ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
<ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk>

Cc: Noor <noor@avens.ae>






Dear Zoey / Ryan 

 

Greetings 

 

Kindly send me the quotation / Invoice for the below.

 

Part Number : OOM103 for Hamilton G5

Qty: 3pc 

 

Part Number : OOM102-1

Brand : Envitec 

Qty: 5

 

Part number : R125P01-009

Description/ Brand: Max 250 

Qty: 1 

 

Maquet Servo I Ventilator#6640044 -  5pc

 

Hamilton T1 Ventilator ,P/N:396200 – 2pc
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4) Viamed 17Vi – 5pc

 

5)R48V  ( Mox 3 ) -   2pc

 

6)Hamilton Medical 396008 O2 sensor
– 3pc

 

Best Regards

 


