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M Gma” Sophie Lines <viamed.sophie.lines@gmail.com>
RE: FW: Quotation request

1 message

farah ELDimassi <info@techno-med.org> Tue, Jul 5, 2022 at 2:36 PM

To: sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk, Kate Griffitths <Kate.Griffiths@viamed.co.uk>
Cc: h-ghandour@hotmail.com

Dear Sophie,

Trust all is well at your end,

First thank you for your reply and clarification, however can you share with me the shipping cost for a qty of 2 of
R-22 oxygen sensor and a gty of 1 box of autoclavable flowsensor.

Looking forward for your inputs.

BR

From: Main Account [mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com] On Behalf Of Sophie Lines
Sent: Tuesday, July 05, 2022 12:17 PM

To: info@techno-med.org; Kate Griffitths <Kate.Griffiths@viamed.co.uk>
Subject: Re: FW: Quotation request

Dear Farah,

Thank you for your email. Kate is currently on annual leave, so please accept my reply.

| can confirm the price for the R-22MED Oxygen Sensor (part number 0110022) is $32.50 EXW.

We supply the Flowsensor SpiroTrue A(PC) which is autoclavable. The part number is 4310002 and they are supplied
in boxes of 5. The costs are as follows:

1+ boxes - $70.85
25+ boxes - $65.00
100+ boxes - $59.15
250+ boxes - $53.30

If you require any further information please do not hesitate to contact us.
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Kind regards
Sophie Lines
Please note: My working days are Monday, Tuesday and Friday

http://www.viamed.co.uk
Emailsophie.lines@viamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and

may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44
(0)1535 634542

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Tue, Jul 5, 2022 at 8:11 AM Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: farah ELDimassi <info@techno-med.org>
Date: Mon, 4 Jul 2022 at 22:06

Subject: RE: FW: Quotation request

To: <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>

Cc: houssein ghandour <h-ghandour@hotmail.com>

Dear Kate,

Hope all is good at your end,

Kindly provide us with the price of the R-22 oxygen sensor . In addition do you supply Autoclavable flow sensor
? if yes kindly advise about the price.

Looking forward to receiving your inputs in return.

BR

Farah EL Dimassi
Tel: 49613793576
TechnoMed s.a.r.l

Beirut Lebanon
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