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Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com>

Re: 8010004 oxygen sensor pricing

1 message

JJ-CCR <jp@jj-ccr.com> 28 June 2022 at 07:32
Reply-To: jp@jj-ccr.com
To: steve.nixon@vandagraphst.com

Hi Steve.


Wow I was under the impression that the reming sensors from June order would ship start off July whit the July order, 


Anyway pleas send as your are surgesting on the 4 - 18 - 22 off July or earlier iff posible and pleas use express
shipping for all the shipments.

Kind regards


Jan Petersen


JJ-CCR ApS  · Dyrlevvej 11 · 4720 Presto · Denmark


Phone direct: +45 40108982


Email:jp@jj-ccr.com


Web: https://jj-ccr.com


On 27 June 2022 at 12:15:02 +02:00, Steve Nixon <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:


Hi Jan


We plan to ship as follows:


CST136546   balance of 268 sensors - 4th July. UPS Express Saver or Express?


CST136875   400 sensors - 18th July. Do you want these shipping as a part shipment or ship with the
balance of 200? UPS Express Saver or Express?


                      200 sensors  - 22nd/25th July. UPS Express Saver or Express?
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CST137482  13 warranty replacement sensors - 22nd/25th July. Will ship with CST136875 above.


I hope that the above is OK with you.


Steve


                    


On Sat, 25 Jun 2022 at 12:11, Steve Nixon <steve.nixon@vandagraphst.com> wrote:

Hi Jan 



We are trying to catch up, but as you know supply chain issues with parts has been causing
problems. I'll provide an update on Monday.



Thank you for the new order for 600 sensors (August).





Steve



On Sat, 25 Jun 2022 at 09:08, JJ-CCR <jp@jj-ccr.com> wrote:


Hi Steve.



AS we are getting closer to 1st week off July is there mabye a small chance that some sensors can
ship out next week.



Also for August can you pleas prepare a shipment off 600 sensors.



Thnaks,







Kind regards








Jan Petersen








JJ-CCR ApS  · Dyrlevvej 11 · 4720 Presto · Denmark
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Phone direct: +45 40108982



Email:jp@jj-ccr.com



Web: https://jj-ccr.com








On 13 June 2022 at 20:17:01 +02:00, Steve Nixon <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:


Hi Jan



We are working towards first week in July, but of course will try earlier.







Steve



On Mon, 13 Jun 2022 at 18:50, JJ-CCR <jp@jj-ccr.com> wrote:


Hi again Steve.



I forgot to ask do you have an idea about when we will see more sensors comming
in.







Kind regards








Jan Petersen








JJ-CCR ApS  · Dyrlevvej 11 · 4720 Presto · Denmark







Phone direct: +45 40108982



Email:jp@jj-ccr.com


Web: https://jj-ccr.com








On 13 June 2022 at 18:25:06 +02:00, Steve Nixon <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:


Dear Jan



As you know we have kept our pricing stable for a very long time,
way back to when the sensor was released in January 2011. 
However, we have finally had to succumb to all the unprecedented
recent increases in costs. We have limited the pricing increase as
much as possible, even though some of the recent cost increases
have been excessive.
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I have had to remove the UPS costs from the price list as these are
ever changing. Shipments will be invoiced at the current UPS rates.



The attached new pricing will not affect existing orders and will come
into effect on the 8th July 2022.





Kind regards



Steve

 

 

Steve Nixon

Director - Vandagraph Sensor Technologies Ltd.



Office:  +44 (0)1535 634900

Mobile: +44 (0)7850 252267
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