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Janine Gill <viamed.janine.gill@gmail.com>

Fwd: OOM109-GH - 10 pcs

1 message

Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> 4 July 2022 at 10:39
Reply-To: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
To: Kate Griffitths <kate.griffiths@vmsecure.me.uk>, Zoey Teal <zoey.teal@vmsecure.me.uk>, Janine Gill
<janine.gill@vmsecure.me.uk>, Aqib Majeed <aqib.majeed@vmsecure.me.uk>, Sophie Lines
<sophie.lines@vmsecure.me.uk>

Hi, please can we send Rajikumar a proforma for 10x OOM109 (0110565) USD $105 each.

Thank you
Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager

VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk

Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542

Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy 


---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: vinyas <sales@vinyaselectronics.in>

Date: Mon, 4 Jul 2022 at 05:41

Subject: RE: OOM109-GH - 10 pcs

To: <ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk>


Hi ryan,

 

Can we get 10 pcs for Sample Quote. Once proven we will go for production Qty.

 

Pls share your best price with lead time.

 

 

 

Regards

Rajkumar S

Director 

VINYAS ELECTRONICS

29C, Shiva Vishnu Avenue,

Kannivakkam, Chennai-603202, Tamilnadu, India.
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mailto:ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
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Mobile: +91  9043890468

Mail: Sales@vinyaselectronics.in

 

From: vinyas [mailto:sales@vinyaselectronics.in] 

Sent: 01 July 2022 10:01
To: 'ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk' <ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk>

Subject: RE: OOM109-GH - 10 pcs

 

Hi Ryan,

 

Thank you for your, input we will check with customer will revert you the same.

 

Regards

Rajkumar S

 

From: Main Account [mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com] On Behalf Of Ryan Swaine

Sent: 30 June 2022 16:08
To: vinyas <sales@vinyaselectronics.in>

Subject: Re: OOM109-GH - 10 pcs

 

Dear Rjikumar

 

Unfortunately we can not get the OOM109-GH, as it is supplied to a specific OWM only. 

However, we can supply the OOM109, which we suspect is the same sensor, but unfortunately we can not guarantee
it:

 

OOM109 - part no. 0110565 = USD $105 each EXW.

Lead time would be approximately 5 weeks from receipt of payment.

 

Best regards

Ryan

 

 

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager

VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk

Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
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Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy 

 

 

On Wed, 29 Jun 2022 at 17:20, vinyas <sales@vinyaselectronics.in> wrote:

Hi Ryan,

 

We have lead time, can you pls check with Envitech team if possible or we are ok with compatible one also.

 

Pls re check once.

 

Regards

Rajkumar S

 

 

 

From: Main Account [mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com] On Behalf Of Ryan Swaine

Sent: 28 June 2022 17:55

To: vinyas <sales@vinyaselectronics.in>

Subject: Re: OOM109-GH - 10 pcs

 

Dear Rajikumar

 

Thank you very much for your enquiry. Unfortunately we do not currently supply a suitable replacement.

 

I am sorry we could not be of more help on this occasion.

 

Best regards

Ryan

 

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager

VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk

Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542

Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy 
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On Tue, 28 Jun 2022 at 09:19, vinyas <sales@vinyaselectronics.in> wrote:

Hi Ryan,

 

Pls quote best possible price for below part.

 

Part number : OOM109-GH

Qty : 10 pcs

 

 

Regards

Rajkumar S

Director 

VINYAS ELECTRONICS

29C, Shiva Vishnu Avenue,

Kannivakkam, Chennai-603202, Tamilnadu, India.

Mobile: +91  9043890468

Mail: Sales@vinyaselectronics.in

 

mailto:sales@vinyaselectronics.in
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