7/1/22, 11:45 AM Gmail - Re: Question - confirm

M Gma" Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>
Re: Question - confirm

1 message

BMG equipment latpikd €idn <bmg.equipment@gmail.com> 1 July 2022 at 11:39

To: kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Dear Kate yes it is ok for the part shipping and the extra cost.
b.r catherine

2nig Map 1 louh 2022 oTig 1:28 p.p., o/n Kate Giriffiths <office@viamed.co.uk> éypawe:
Good morning Catherine,

Just a quick email to see if you would like part shipment with the additional cost for the extra shipment, as per my previous email?
Many thanks.
Kind regards
Kate Griffiths
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On Tue, 28 Jun 2022 at 12:02, Kate Griffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Hi Catherine,

We can part ship, we would invoice you the additional carriage for sending the 0110803.
The charge would be approximately €34.34.

Are you happy to accept this?

Thank you.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths
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