01/07/2022, 11:12 Gmail - Fwd: Purchase order 2470, R17MED oxygen sensor cells

M Gmail

Sophie Lines <viamed.sophie.lines@gmail.com>

Fwd: Purchase order 2470, R17MED oxygen sensor cells

1 message

Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk>
To: Sophie Lines <sophie.lines@vmsecure.me.uk>

—————————— Forwarded message ---------

From: <spencerphillips@thediverclinic.com>

Date: Fri, 1 Jul 2022 at 11:03

Subject: Purchase order 2470, R17MED oxygen sensor cells
To: <orders@viamed.co.uk>

Purchase Order No. 2470

Delivery and Billing Address

Atlantic Enterprise UK Ltd
7 Parkstone Road

Poole, Dorset

BH15 2NN

VAT No. 619 647 900

Telephone 01202 678278

Email spencerphillips@thediverclinic.com
Contact Spencer Phillips

Delivery Asap

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=d 104de5290&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f%3A1737144467286887505%7Cmsg-f%3A173714446...

Fri, Jul 1, 2022 at 11:07 AM

Supplier

Viamed Limited

15 Station Road, Cross Hills
Keighley, West Yorkshire
BD20 7DT

United Kingdom

Telephone (0)1535 634 542

Fax (0)1535 635 582
Email orders@yviamed.co.uk
Website www.viamed.co.uk
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Account 00012003 Contact -

Payment Terms On account

Order Details:
Qty Part Product Description Unit Price Sub-Total
2 0110017 Oxygen sensor, R-17MED 40.00 80.00

Goods Total £80.00
Carriage Free
Sub-Total £80.00

VAT @ 20% £16.00
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Total Order Cost £96.00

N.B. A delivery note is required with all goods. We reserve the right to reject any goods not meeting required standard.

For office use only:

Indicate goods received with an asterisk (*) Authorised by:
Delivery date: Delivery note no.
Dear Viamed

Please contact me between 9am — 3pm Monday to Friday if payment by card is required and | would be grateful if you
could confirm the order by email when we will receive them.

Kind regards

Spencer Phillips

Registered Manager

Tel: 01202 678278
Email: spencerphillips@thediverclinic.com

Website: www.thediverclinic.com and www.diverclinicdorset.nhs.uk

Service provided by: m

) THE DIVER CLINIC Diving and Hyperbaric
Medicine Unit
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MEDICAL SOCIETY

Raising the quality of practice one member at a time

Q CareQuality
Commission

Regulated by {]1/ UNDERSEA & HYPERBARIC =~
WY

Notice
This email, together with any attachments, is intended for the named addressee(s) only. It contains information which may be confidential and
which may also be privileged. Unless you are the named addressee, you may neither copy nor use it nor disclose it to anyone else. If you

have received it in error, please notify me immediately by return email and delete the message from your computer.

The Diver Clinic cannot accept any liability for any loss or damage sustained as a result of software viruses. It is your responsibility to carry out

such virus checking as is necessary before opening any attachment.

The Diver Clinic is a trading name of Atlantic Enterprise UK Ltd, registered in the England, Midland House, 2 Poole Road, Bournemouth BH2 5QY

Company number 272 6698
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