helen lamb <viamed.helen.lamb@gmail.com>

Fwd: Your Royal Mail Online Shop order confirmation
1 message

Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> 29 June 2022 at 16:14
Reply-To: ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
To: Helen Lamb <helen.lamb@viamed.co.uk>

Hi Helen
Paid on Viamed CC for Vandagraph

Thank you, Ryan

Ryan Swaine

General Manager

VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk

Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Royal Mail <support@royalmail.com>

Date: Wed, 29 Jun 2022 at 16:12

Subject: Your Royal Mail Online Shop order confirmation
To: Mr. Ryan Swaine <ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk>

Postage and Packaging Special stamp issues Collectibles and Gifts
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Hello Mr. Ryan Swaine, \ / '/\,/\ ' L(?—\('

) \/l(:‘/\—

Thank you for your order from Royal Mail Online Shop.

Your order details are indicated below. If your order contains purchased items, we will send you an email
confirming when your item(s) have been dispatched.

If you have questions about your order, you can contact us by visiting www.royalmail.com/stampsenquiries or call
us at 03457 641 641.

Your Order #408067601

Placed on 29 Jun 2022 16:11:50




Billing address Delivery Address

Mr. Ryan Swaine Mr. Ryan Swaine
Vandagraph Ltd Vandagraph Ltd
15 Station Road 15 Station Road
Cross Hills Cross Hills
Keighley, BD20 7DT Keighley, BD20 7DT
United Kingdom United Kingdom
T: 01535634900 T: 01535634900
Payment method Delivery Method
Card Payment ECMC-SSL Free - UK Standard
Items Qty Price
10 X £5.00 Stamp Sheet 2 £100.00
SKU: SHB5X
Sheet of 25 x 10p stamps 2 £5.00
SKU: DB10
Sheet of 25 x 5p stamps 5 £6.25
SKU: DB05
Sheet of 25 x 1p stamps 1 £0.25
SKU: DBO1
Subtotal £111.50
Delivery £0.00
Order Total £111.50

185 Farringdon Road, London
EC1A 1AA




WChamber
International

Preferred supplier of international

trade services to Chambers of

Commerce
Invoiced To:
Viamed Ltd
15 Station Road Crosshills
KEIGHLEY BD20 7DT
Sold To:
Viamed Ltd
15 Station Road Crosshills
KEIGHLEY BD20 7DT
InvoiceNumber: 000174821
Membership/Record Number: 530533
Account No. Purchase Order Order Date Order Number Terms Invoice Date
No.
530533 12/05/2022 Due on Receipt 12/05/2022
Line Qty Description Unit Price £ Extended | VATE£
No. Price £
1. 1 0000472116 - e-z Cert Express - ref:RAN135223-1 468079 £53.30 £53.30 £10.66
2022-05-12
Line Item Total Total Tax: 20% Overall Total | Amount Received | Credits Applied Amount Due
£53.30 £10.66 £63.96 £0.00 £0.00 £63.96

Bank Details for Payment by BACS or direct Payment are:
RBS, 45-47, Bank Street, BRADFORD, BD1 1TS

Sortcode: 16-14-17 Account Number: 10193439 Quote Reference: 530533

VAT Registration No: 179 3906 20
Company No: 00054940

T:(01274) 772777
F: (01274) 771587
W: www.chamber-international.com
E: info@chamB\er—intrrnational.com

Registered Office: Devere House, Vicar Lane,
Little Germany, Bradford, BD1 SAH

Chamber International and Chamber Management Services are trading names used by West & North Yorkshire Chamber of Commerce. 1




wimali helen lamb <viamed.helen.lamb@gmail.com>

Your Thomas Higgins Order Confirmation [Reference: LBA772332-66282-56461]

2 messages

credit.control@thomashiggins.com <credit.control@thomashiggins.com> 22 June 2022 at 15:41
To: helen.lamb@viamed.co.uk

THOMAS HIGGINS

Y/ LIMITED Solicitors

Business Debt Collection & Recoveryl

Hello HELEN,
Thank you for using Thomas Higgins Debt Collection services. Here is a summary of your
payment:

Order Number: LBA772332-66282-56461

Order Date: 22/06/2022

Total Instructions: 1

Costs: £25.00

VAT: £5.00

Grand Total: £30.00

Kind Regards,

Thomas Higgins Limited

Thomas Higgins Limited, Registered In England & Wales: 10177315
Registered Office: Lloyds Chambers 19-21 Seaview Road, Wallasey, CH45 4TH
Licensed and regulated by the Solicitors Regulation Authority SRA Number: 630440
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Mail Delivery System <MAILER-DAEMON@smtpin-365-04.cmp.livemail.co.uk> 22 June 2022 at 15:42
To: viamed.helen.lamb+caf_=goldmine=viamed.co.uk@gmail.com

This is the mail system at host mailserver-out.cmp.livemail.co.uk.

I'm sorry to have to inform you that your message could not
be delivered to one or more recipients. It's attached below.

For further assistance, please send mail to postmaster.

If you do so, please include this problem report. You can
delete your own text from the attached returned message.




) +44(0)20 7700 2777 :
) Invoice 0000411080
VDC House sales@vdctrading.com
4 Brandon Road www.vdctrading.com Date 21/06/2022
Kings Cross, VAT No. 471 8323 43
. London N7 9AA WEB Order 0000335210
Your Order Ryan Swaine
I . Account Ref W2000372
Ryan Swaine AS INVOICED
15 Station Road
Cross Hills
Keighley
North Yorkshire
BD20 7DT
All Amounts in  Pounds Sterling
Item Code Description Quantity Unit Price Net VAT Rate %
211311100 1 Pair Audio Foil Screened Twin Black 100m Reel 1 48.50 48.50 20
COURIER UK MAINLAND BEFORE 12 1 12.50 12.50 20
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Processed By: DAVID
Phone 07803907117
Delivery Date: 22/06/2022 Total Net 61.00 12.20
Your VAT Number GB et e -

Main agent for Van Damme products

> ROHS/




helen lamb <viamed.helen.lamb@gmail.com>

Fwd: Your VDC TRADING LIMITED receipt [#1047-8581]

1 message

Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> 20 June 2022 at 17:15
Reply-To: ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
To: Helen Lamb <helen.lamb@viamed.co.uk>

Hi Helen
Paid on my Viamed CC, but it is for Vandagraph.

Thank you, Ryan

Ryan Swaine

General Manager

VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk

Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: VDC TRADING LIMITED <receipts+acct_11Ed1zE7pLIuYcFE@stripe.com>
Date: Mon, 20 Jun 2022 at 17:14

Subject: Your VDC TRADING LIMITED receipt [#1047-8581]

To: <ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk>

VG

Receipt from VDC TRADING LIMITED

Receipt N0.1047-8581

AMOUNT PAID DATE PAID PAYMENT METHOD
SUMMARY

YL
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Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com>

Order Confirmation - 220620-043730

1 message

VDC Trading <sales@vdctrading.com> 20 June 2022 at 17:14
To: ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk

Order confirmation

Order #

Order Date: Jun 20th, 2022

Thank you for shopping at VDCTrading.com. Please take a moment to check the order
details shown below. If you want to make any changes, please contact us as soon as

possible at sales@vdctrading.com.

Please note all YouSpec designs and made to order manufactured items are subject to a
lead time. Delivery date will be confirmed in your VDC Trading order acknowledgement
email. Contact us at sales@vdctrading.com quoting your order reference if you need a

shorter delivery time.

Customer: ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk Delivery Method: Next Day Delivery, before 12pm
Phone number: 07803907117

Order number: #43730

Order date: Jun 20th, 2022

Account Ref: : W2000372

Invoice Address Delivery Address
Ryan Swaine Ryan Swaine
Vandagraph Ltd 15 Station Road
15 Station Road Cross Hills

Cross Hills Keighley




Keighley
BD20 7DT
United Kingdom

VDC Contractor PVC 1 pair audio cable, black,

100m reel.

SKU 211-311-100

Subtotal: £48.50

Delivery: £12.50

VAT: £12.20

Order Total: £73.20

Order number: 220620-043730
Summary Notes:

Total weight: 1.69kg

Got a question? Email us at

BD20 7DT
United Kingdom

Qty 1

n or give us a call at +

©® 2021 VDC Trading, Inc. All Rights Reserved.

VDC House, 4 Brandon Road, Kings Cross, London N7 9AA

Total: £48.50




G Mma ? ; helen lamb <viamed.helen.lamb@gmail.com>

Fwd: Royal Mail - Postage Confirmation for WP-1918-5590-690

1 message

Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> 14 June 2022 at 17:19
Reply-To: ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
To: Helen Lamb <helen.lamb@viamed.co.uk>

Hi Helen
Paid on my Viamed CC for Vandagraph.
Ryan

Ryan Swaine
General Manager
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.

http://lwww.vandagraph.co.uk "
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk )

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117 (?y/k’ ’

---------- Forwarded message --------- t —
From: Royal Mail Support <no-reply@royalmail.com> \/

Date: Tue, 14 Jun 2022 at 17:15

Subject: Royal Mail - Postage Confirmation for WP-1918-5590-690

To: <ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk>

e d’pdvsz |

Royal Mail W

Thank you for your order.

You have made a payment of £2.85 to the Royal Mail Group Ltd.
Reference: WP-1918-5590-690
Date & time: Tuesday, 14 June 2022 17:14

You have confirmed that you are not sending any item which is prohibited or restricted in the UK.

A summary of your purchase is set out below, and details of this purchase - along with links to re-download your
documents and view your QR codes, and request refunds - will remain available for you to view for up to 21 days
on the payment confirmation page.

Purchased postage

Destination: Ryan Swaine, Vandagraph Ltd, 15 Station Road, Cross Hills, Keighley, North Yorkshire, BD20
7DT

Postage service: Royal Mail 2nd Class
Postage cost: £2.85
Item must be posted by: Tuesday, 21 June 2022




B
WChamber
International

Preferred supplier of international
trade services to Chambers of

Commerce
Invoiced To:
Viamed Ltd
15 Station Road Crosshills
KEIGHLEY BD20 7DT
Sold To:
Viamed Ltd
15 Station Road Crosshills
KEIGHLEY BD20 7DT
InvoiceNumber: 000173842
Membership/Record Number: 530533
Account No. Purchase Order Order Date Order Number Terms Invoice Date
No.
530533 07/04/2022 Due on Receipt 07/04/2022
Line Qty Description Unit Price £ Extended | VATE
No. Price £
1. 1 0000467596 - e-z Cert Express - ref;RAN135100-1 463559 £53.30 £53.30 £10.66
2022-04-07
Line Item Total Total Tax: 20% Overall Total | Amount Received | Credits Applied Amount Due
£53.30 £10.66 £63.96 £0.00 £0.00 £63.96

Bank Details for Payment by BACS or direct Payment are:

RBS, 45-47, Bank Street, BRADFORD, BD1 1TS
Sortcode: 16-14-17 Account Number: 10193439

Quote Reference: 530533

Registered Office: Devere House, Vicar Lane,
Little Germany, Bradford, BD1 5AH

T:(01274) 772777

F:(01274) 771587

W: www.chamber-international.com
E: info@chamber-international.com
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VAT Registration No: 179 3906 20
Company No: 00054940

Chamber International and Chamber Management Services are trading names used by West & North Yorkshire Chamber of Commerce. 1




