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Aqib Majeed <viamed.aqib.majeed@gmail.com>

Fwd: FW: SALES ENQUIRY


Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> 27 June 2022 at 15:34
To: Aqib Majeed <aqib.majeed@vmsecure.me.uk>

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Kevin Watson <Kevin.Watson@gibbtools.com>

Date: Mon, 27 Jun 2022 at 15:31

Subject: FW: SALES ENQUIRY

To: viamedinbox@gmail.com <viamedinbox@gmail.com>


Hi Aqib

 

 

Yeh that’s fine please proceed

 

PLEASE NOTE NEW EMAIL ADDRESS 

Kind Regards

 

KEVIN WATSON

Sales | Gibb Tools & Supplies

T
+44 (0) 1224 620940 |
Option 1   

E
kevin.watson@gibbtools.com
| sales@gibbtools.com 

A: 303 King Street, Aberdeen, AB24 5AP, UK 


M: Connect with us on LinkedIn 

 

 

 

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com>
On Behalf Of Aqib Majeed

Sent: 27 June 2022 15:29

To: Kevin Watson <Kevin.Watson@gibbtools.com>

Subject: Re: SALES ENQUIRY

 

Hello Kevin Good Afternoon 

 

I have attached your proforma invoice to this email detailing prices and product with carriage included, if your happy
with this price please let me know so I can turn this proforma into a order and get it ready for dispatch.

 

Thank you.
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