27/06/2022, 09:24 Gmail - Fwd: Question - confirm

M Gma” Zoey Teal <viamed.zoey.teal@gmail.com>
Fwd: Question - confirm

1 message

Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> Mon, Jun 27, 2022 at 8:32 AM

To: Zoey Teal <zoey.teal@vmsecure.me.uk>

—————————— Forwarded message ---------

From: bmg.equipment <bmg.equipment@gmail.com>
Date: Sat, 25 Jun 2022 at 13:51

Subject: Question - confirm

To: <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>

Dear kate,

Hello!

OK, send us 02 sensor r-49 ......... x 10 pcs
Also we need price for :

1)0110453 , nax250ms

and if you have new price list , please send it
Please comment

B.R

Anastasios

On 24-Jun-22 4:31 PM, Kate Griffiths wrote:

Good afternoon Anastasios,

Our commercial director is struggling to obtain information about the availability of part number
0110024. | am able to offer an alternative in stock - the R-49V which costs €36 each..

Please let me know if you would like the alternative. | have attached a data sheet.
Thank you for your patience.

Many thanks.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin staff to work
from home, and | am now working remotely. Telephone calls to the main office will be answered

remotely, but please continue to use email where possible.

http://www.viamed.co.uk
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