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M Gma” Zoey Teal <viamed.zoey.teal@gmail.com>
Fwd: 8010004 oxygen sensor pricing

1 message

Steve Nixon <office@viamed.co.uk> Sat, Jun 25, 2022 at 12:28 PM

Reply-To: steve.nixon@vandagraphst.com
To: office@vmsecure.me.uk

Please process the VST order from JJ-CCR for:
600 x 8010004 Required for August, use 9th August as the initial due date.

Ship UPS Express Saver service.

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: JJ-CCR <jp@)jj-ccr.com>

Date: Sat, 25 Jun 2022 at 09:08

Subject: Re: 8010004 oxygen sensor pricing
To: <steve.nixon@vandagraphst.com>

Hi Steve.

AS we are getting closer to 1st week off July is there mabye a small chance that some sensors can ship out next
week.

Also for August can you pleas prepare a shipment off 600 sensors.

Thnaks,

Kind regards

Jan Petersen

JJ-CCR ApS - Dyrlevvej 11 - 4720 Presto - Denmark

Phone direct: +45 40108982

Email:jp@jj-ccr.com

Web: https://jj-ccr.com
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On 13 June 2022 at 20:17:01 +02:00, Steve Nixon <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

Hi Jan

We are working towards first week in July, but of course will try earlier.

Steve

On Mon, 13 Jun 2022 at 18:50, JJ-CCR <jp@)jj-ccr.com> wrote:
Hi again Steve.

| forgot to ask do you have an idea about when we will see more sensors comming in.

Kind regards

Jan Petersen

JJ-CCR ApS - Dyrlevvej 11 - 4720 Presto - Denmark

Phone direct: +45 40108982

Email:jp@jj-ccr.com

Web: https://jj-ccr.com

On 13 June 2022 at 18:25:06 +02:00, Steve Nixon <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=77e4056450&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f%3A1736605973984629138&simpl=msg-f%3A173660...

Dear Jan

As you know we have kept our pricing stable for a very long time, way back to when the
sensor was released in January 2011. However, we have finally had to succumb to all
the unprecedented recent increases in costs. We have limited the pricing increase as
much as possible, even though some of the recent cost increases have been
excessive.

I have had to remove the UPS costs from the price list as these are ever changing.
Shipments will be invoiced at the current UPS rates.

The attached new pricing will not affect existing orders and will come into effect on the
8th July 2022.
Kind regards

Steve
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Steve Nixon
Director - Vandagraph Sensor Technologies Ltd.

Office: +44 (0)1535 634900
Mobile: +44 (0)7850 252267
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