24/06/2022, 14:40 Gmail - Fwd: MAX-250A - part no. 0110431

M Gma” Agib Majeed <viamed.agib.majeed@gmail.com>

Fwd: MAX-250A - part no. 0110431

Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> 24 June 2022 at 13:58
Reply-To: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk

To: Kate Giriffitths <kate.griffiths@vmsecure.me.uk>, Zoey Teal <zoey.teal@vmsecure.me.uk>, Sophie Lines
<sophie.lines@vmsecure.me.uk>, Janine Gill <janine.gill@vmsecure.me.uk>, Agib Majeed
<agib.majeed@vmsecure.me.uk>

Hi,
Please can we provide Abubakar (CID11434) with a proforma invoice for the 6x MAX-250A sensors we have in stock.

Thank you, Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

—————————— Forwarded message ---------

From: Info <info@medgill.co.uk>

Date: Fri, 24 Jun 2022 at 13:53

Subject: RE: MAX-250A - part no. 0110431

To: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk <ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk>

Hi,

Thankyou for your response.
Please share proforma Invoice for 6 X Max-250A.
Kindly also let us know what the delivery time is as well, we need it urgently.

Awaiting your response.

Kind Regards,

Abubakar

Director

MedGill Ltd

87 — Longmead Road
UB3 2HF Hayes, London
United Kingdom

info@medagill.co.uk

C: +447404456671
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