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Aqib Majeed <viamed.aqib.majeed@gmail.com>

RE: FW: Oxygen analysers


Fowler Geoff <Geoff.Fowler@gstt.nhs.uk> 14 June 2022 at 16:07
To: Aqib Majeed <office@viamed.co.uk>

Perfect, thank you.

 

Geoff

 

From: Main Account [mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com]
On Behalf Of Aqib Majeed

Sent: 14 June 2022 16:00
To: Fowler Geoff <Geoff.Fowler@gstt.nhs.uk>

Subject: Re: FW: Oxygen analysers

 

Hi Geoff 

 

Yes we can arrange a courier and let you know how much it will cost, once i have received the courier label i will send
it over to you by email. 

 

Kind regards 

 

Aqib Majeed

 

http://www.viamed.co.uk

email: aqib.majeed@viamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

 

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

 

E-mail Disclaimer

-----------------

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
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If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in
reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

 

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

 

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk

 

 

On Tue, 14 Jun 2022 at 15:42, Fowler Geoff <Geoff.Fowler@gstt.nhs.uk> wrote:

Hi Aqib,

 

Thank you for the returns number. Do you have, or are you able to send, a courier for collection? I
am unsure
how to proceed with just this number as I cannot arrange a courier at present.

 

Any information greatly appreciated. Obviously any extra cost will be paid by the Trust.

 

Kind Regards,

 

Geoff

 

From: Main
Account [mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com]
On Behalf Of Aqib Majeed

Sent: 14 June 2022 11:21

To: Fowler Geoff <Geoff.Fowler@gstt.nhs.uk>

Subject: Re: FW: Oxygen analysers

 

Hi Geoff

 

Your returns number is SRS68203

 

Kind regards 

 

Aqib Majeed

 

http://www.viamed.co.uk

email: aqib.majeed@viamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
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