09/06/2022, 12:07 Gmail - RE: R22-VAN

M Gma” Ryan Swaine <viamed.ryan.swaine@gmail.com>

RE: R22-VAN

1 message

Oli van Overbeek <oli@divelife.co.uk> 9 June 2022 at 11:57
To: "ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk" <ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk>

Hey bud, total paid 475.20

| have invoice 27-1 but | don’t have 32-1, can you re send this one please?

Also can | have 4 more analysers with quick ox

Oli

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Ryan Swaine
Sent: 13 May 2022 11:43

To: Oli van Overbeek <oli@divelife.co.uk>

Subject: Re: R22-VAN

Hi Oli
Thank you, | will try and have your sensors in the post today.

Please can you do me a favour and make a payment for the outstanding invoice? | have attached a statement for
your reference.

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

General Manager
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.

http://www.vandagraph.co.uk

Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117
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On Fri, 13 May 2022 at 10:24, Oli van Overbeek <oli@divelife.co.uk> wrote:

Hi Ryan,

Hope you are well buddy,

Can we urgently have 2x R22-VAN popped in the post to us?

OLi

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=7e81c75fe0&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f%3A1732702518500611999%7Cmsg-f%3A1735154498... 2/2


mailto:oli@divelife.co.uk

