07/06/2022, 15:23 Gmail - Fwd: FW: Purchase Order

M Gmail Agib Majeed <viamed.agib.majeed@gmail.com>

Fwd: FW: Purchase Order

Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk>
To: Agib Majeed <agib.majeed@vmsecure.me.uk>

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: HOWARD, Sophy (ROYAL CORNWALL HOSPITALS NHS TRUST) <sophy.howard1@nhs.net>
Date: Tue, 7 Jun 2022 at 15:09

Subject: FW: Purchase Order

To: agib.majeed@viamed.co.uk <agib.majeed@viamed.co.uk>

Good Afternoon,

Please dispatch with carriage at £8.00.

Kind Regards

Sophy

Sophy Howard || Cornwall NHS Procurement Service
General Buyer | Royal Cornwall Hospital | 2" Floor Carlyon House

Penventinnie Lane | Treliske | Truro | Cornwall | TR1 3LJ

INHS |

Cornwall Procurement Service
( Tel: 07584 223548
“To Improve Quality of Life’ § : Email:sophy.howard1@nhs.net
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From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Aqib Majeed
Sent: 06 June 2022 14:08

To: BEALL, Peter (ROYAL CORNWALL HOSPITALS NHS TRUST) <peter.beall@nhs.net>
Subject: Purchase Order

This message originated from outside of NHSmail. Please do not click links or open attachments unless you recognise the sender and know the content is safe.

Agib Majeed <aqib.majeed@viamed.co.uk>

to peter.beall

Hi Peter Good morning,

Thank you for your purchase order, order no: 22003773.
1114006 EYEMAX 2 NEONATAL PHOTOTHERAPY MASK x1
1114007 EYEMAX 2 NEONATAL PHOTOTHERAPY MASK x1

You order has been processed however we are unfortunately unable to dispatch it as there is a carriage charge of £8.00, please let me know if that is
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