06/06/2022, 16:42 Gmail - Re: Oxygen sensor R-22A

M Gma” Sophie Lines <viamed.sophie.lines@gmail.com>

Re: Oxygen sensor R-22A

1 message

TREE LAM REVITEX <revitex.treelam@gmail.com> Mon, Jun 6, 2022 at 4:01 PM
To: sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk

I'll give you two names
Company's path : ABDELADIM ALOUI
center chief : KAOUTAR AGHRIBI

Le lun. 6 juin 2022 a 13:53, Sophie Lines <office@viamed.co.uk> a écrit :
Thank you for your company details - the only thing we are missing from the Proforma is the best person to contact
regarding the order if there is a problem with delivery - who's name shall we add please?

Kind regards

Sophie Lines

Please note: My working days are Monday, Tuesday and Friday

We are currently working remotely however telephone calls to the main office will still be answered.

http://www.viamed.co.uk
Emailsophie.lines@viamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and
may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44
(0)1535 634542

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: TREE LAM REVITEX <revitex.treelam@gmail.com>
Date: Mon, Jun 6, 2022 at 9:57 AM

Subject: Re: Oxygen sensor R-22A

To: <zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk>

For information about our centre

We are located in the city of Asilah BAYTI SAKAN , the residence of Building No 195,196,197,198 ASILAH
CENTRE.

Center name : TREELAM SARL

Phone number : 00212679091262 (Personnel)

Phone Number of Centre :00212539416850

ICE : 001435123000075

N° d'autorisation of centre : 1738/2017

area code : 90050

City : Asilah/morocco
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| would like to know the price in detail
and payment method

Oxygen sensor R-22A
Thanks

Le lun. 6 juin 2022 a 08:30, Zoey Teal <office@viamed.co.uk> a écrit :
Good morning,

Please can | have a contact name for this order and our records, your full name etc?

If you have any further queries, please do not hesitate to contact me.

Kind regards

Zoey Teal

Please note: My working days are Monday to Thursday, 7.45am-6.00pm.

We are currently working remotely however telephone calls to the main office will still be answered.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email: zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk

Alternate email: viamed.zoey.teal@gmail.com
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Sign up to our mailing list, go to www.viamed.co.uk/sign-up

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: facebook.com/ViamedLtdUK

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer
GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be
taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply
with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Fri, Jun 3, 2022 at 9:38 AM TREE LAM REVITEX <revitex.treelam@gmail.com> wrote:
hello
Sorry | didn't understand what you said

Le mer. 1 juin 2022 a 14:14, Zoey Teal <office@viamed.co.uk> a écrit :
Good afternoon,

Please can you provide a contact name for our records?
If you have any further queries, please do not hesitate to contact me.
Kind regards

Zoey Teal
Please note: My working days are Monday to Thursday, 7.45am-6.00pm.

We are currently working remotely however telephone calls to the main office will still be
answered.
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http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email: zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk

Alternate email: viamed.zoey.teal@gmail.com
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Sign up to our mailing list, go to www.viamed.co.uk/sign-up

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: facebook.com/ViamedLtdUK

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer
GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

Itis intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to
be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please
reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Wed, Jun 1, 2022 at 2:08 PM TREE LAM REVITEX <revitex.treelam@gmail.com> wrote:
area code : 90050

City : Asilah/morocco

Le mer. 1 juin 2022 a 13:57, Zoey Teal <office@viamed.co.uk> a écrit :
Good afternoon,

I am currently in the process of creating your proforma invoice.

Our UPS system requires that we have the zip/area code so that we can work out the carriage cost.
Please can you confirm what this is?

Please can you also confirm which contact name to use for our records?
If you have any further queries, please do not hesitate to contact me.
Kind regards

Zoey Teal

Please note: My working days are Monday to Thursday, 7.45am-6.00pm.

We are currently working remotely however telephone calls to the main office will still be
answered.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email: zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk

Alternate email: viamed.zoey.teal@gmail.com
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Sign up to our mailing list, go to www.viamed.co.uk/sign-up

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: facebook.com/ViamedLtdUK

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer
GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy
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Gmail - Re: Oxygen sensor R-22A

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or
omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list,
please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Wed, Jun 1, 2022 at 12:29 PM Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

—————————— Forwarded message ---------

From: TREE LAM REVITEX <revitex.treelam@gmail.com>
Date: Wed, 1 Jun 2022 at 12:27

Subject: Re: Oxygen sensor R-22A

To: <sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk>

Hello

Sorry for the delay

For information about our centre

We are located in the city of Asilah BAYTI SAKAN , the residence of Building No 195,196,197,198
ASILAH CENTRE.

Center name : TREELAM SARL

Phone number : 00212679091262 (Personnel)
Phone Number of Centre :00212539416850
ICE : 001435123000075

N° d'autorisation of centre : 1738/2017

| would like to know the price in detail

and payment method

Thanks

Le ven. 27 mai 2022 a 16:14, Sophie Lines <office@viamed.co.uk> a écrit :
Hi,

Thank you for your reply. We have the R-22A in stock, so we can dispatch within 1-2 days from
receipt of payment.

If you can let me know your company details - delivery and invoice address, contact numbers etc

- | can put this together in an official quotation for you. | am unable to calculate delivery costs or
time without a delivery address.

Kind regards
Sophie Lines
Please note: My working days are Monday, Tuesday and Friday

We are currently working remotely however telephone calls to the main office will still be
answered.

http://www.viamed.co.uk
Emailsophie.lines@viamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance

on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.
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If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the
subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Fri, May 27, 2022 at 4:06 PM TREE LAM REVITEX <revitex.treelam@gmail.com> wrote:
Now | need 2
| will need more later
Do you have an idea for delivery?
How much is the total?

Le ven. 27 mai 2022 & 14:32, Sophie Lines <office@viamed.co.uk> a écrit :

Thank you for your reply.

I can confirm the price per unit is $55.00 EXW - how many units are looking to purchase? If
you let me know your delivery details, | can send you a Proforma Invoice which will
include the delivery costs to you in Morocco, via our Courier UPS.

Kind regards
Sophie Lines
Please note: My working days are Monday, Tuesday and Friday

We are currently working remotely however telephone calls to the main office will still
be answered.

http://www.viamed.co.uk
Emailsophie.lines@viamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in
reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete
in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Fri, May 27, 2022 at 12:18 PM TREE LAM REVITEX <revitex.treelam@gmail.com>
wrote:
hello

| will use it for pollution control of cars
We are a technical vehicle inspection center In

Morocco
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Le ven. 27 mai 2022 a 11:28, Sophie Lines <office@viamed.co.uk> a écrit :
Good morning,

Thank you for your inquiry - please can you let me know some further details on
whether you will be the end-user of the R-22A, and which country you are based?

Kind regards
Sophie Lines
Please note: My working days are Monday, Tuesday and Friday

We are currently working remotely however telephone calls to the main office will
still be answered.

http://www.viamed.co.uk
Emailsophie.lines@viamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be
taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Fri, May 27, 2022 at 10:39 AM Main Account <office@yviamed.co.uk> wrote:

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: TREE LAM REVITEX <revitex.treelam@gmail.com>

Date: Fri, 27 May 2022 at 10:35

Subject: Oxygen sensor R-22A

To: <sales@viamed.co.uk>, <orders@viamed.co.uk>, <enquiries@viamed.co.uk>,
<iso@viamed.co.uk>

Hello ,

Please | would like to know the price of the product oxygen sensor Class R -22 A
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