31/05/2022, 10:07 Gmail - Fwd: Quote - Oxygen Sensor

M Gma" Zoey Teal <viamed.zoey.teal@gmail.com>

Fwd: Quote - Oxygen Sensor
1 message

Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> Tue, May 31, 2022 at 9:58 AM
Reply-To: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk

To: Kate Giriffitths <kate.griffiths@vmsecure.me.uk>, Zoey Teal <zoey.teal@vmsecure.me.uk>, Janine Gill
<janine.gill@vmsecure.me.uk>, Agib Majeed <aqib.majeed@vmsecure.me.uk>, Sophie Lines
<sophie.lines@vmsecure.me.uk>

Hi
Please can we set up an account and send a proforma invoice (Carriage EXW):

1x OOM111 - part no. 0110560 = USD $64 each EXW
1x R-17Vi - part no. 0110019 = USD $32.50 each EXW
1x R-49V - part no. 0110049 = USD $37.75 each EXW

Syed Ali
Managing Director
AVENS
st 9 Office. No: 1507
SIT Tower, Dubai Silicon Oasis
Dubai - United Arab Emirates
+971563356076
+971 45 91 81 83
director@avens.ae; www.avens.ae

B & 0O

Thank you
Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy
---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Syed Ali <Director@avens.ae>

Date: Mon, 30 May 2022 at 17:36

Subject: Re: Quote - Oxygen Sensor

To: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk <ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk>
Cc: Noor <noor@avens.ae>

Dear Ryan

Greetings

Kindly send us the invoice to proceed for the payment.

We will arrange our forwarder to collect the package once its ready.
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Waiting for your further reply.

Best regards

Syed Ali
Managing Director
NAWLV”E““NS 9 Office. No: 1507
SIT Tower, Dubai Silicon Oasis

Dubai - United Arab Emirates
0 +971563356076
% +97145918183
&2 director@avens.ae; www.avens.ae

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> on behalf of Ryan Swaine
<office@viamed.co.uk>

Date: Monday, 30 May 2022 at 3:04 PM

To: Syed Ali <Director@avens.ae>

Cc: Noor <noor@avens.ae>

Subject: Re: Quote - Oxygen Sensor

Dear Syed

Thank you for your email.

Please find our sensor information and pricing below:

Envitec OOM111 - part no. 0110560 = USD $64 each EXW

OOM102-01

If this is the OOM102-1, then we can supply the following compatible sensor:

Viamed R-17Vi (manufactured by Envitec) - part no. 0110019 = USD $32.50 each EXW

OOM202

We can supply our Viamed R-49V (manufactured by Envitec) - part no. 0110049 = USD $37.75 each EXW

| will await your feedback.

Best regards

Ryan

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=77e4056450&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f%3A1734331613414168086&simpl=msg-f%3A173433...  2/5


mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com
mailto:office@viamed.co.uk
mailto:Director@avens.ae
mailto:noor@avens.ae

31/05/2022, 10:07 Gmail - Fwd: Quote - Oxygen Sensor

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Mon, 30 May 2022 at 10:58, Syed Ali <Director@avens.ae> wrote:

Dear Ryan

Good day.

Waiting for the quote.

Thanks and regards

Syed Ali
Managing Director
“Aungys 9 office. No: 1507

SIT Tower, Dubai Silicon Oasis
Dubai - United Arab Emirates

0 4971563356076

© 497145918183

= director@avens.ae; www.avens.ae

From: Syed Ali <Director@avens.ae>

Date: Saturday, 28 May 2022 at 10:40 AM

To: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk <ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk>
Cc: Noor <noor@avens.ae>

Subject: Re: Quote - Oxygen Sensor

Dear Ryan

Good Day

Thanks for your kind reply.

We are one of the leading medical Consumable Supplier in UAE.

We do have requirement on monthly basis and the quantity differs on each time.

To begin the order with viamed, as a startup, | would like to go with 1pc each of the item requested.
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| appreciate your best dealer quotation.

Best Regards

Syed Ali
Managing Director
“AuuV”EM,NS 9 Office. No: 1507
SIT Tower, Dubai Silicon Oasis

Dubai - United Arab Emirates
0 4971563356076
% +97145918183
&2 director@avens.ae; www.avens.ae

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> on behalf of Ryan Swaine
<office@viamed.co.uk>

Date: Thursday, 26 May 2022 at 12:20 PM

To: Syed Ali <Director@avens.ae>

Subject: Re: Quote - Oxygen Sensor

Dear Syed Al
Thank you very much for your email.

| would be very happy to quote you for the sensors you listed, but first can you please let me know some
information about your organisation or hospital?

Please can you let me know how many of the sensors listed you are likely to require?
Thank you in advance and | look forward to hearing from you.

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542

Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: Syed Ali <Director@avens.ae>
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Date: Wed, 25 May 2022, 14:12

Subject: Quote - Oxygen Sensor

To: sales@viamed.co.uk <sales@viamed.co.uk>, orders@viamed.co.uk <orders@viamed.co.uk>,
enquiries@viamed.co.uk <enquiries@viamed.co.uk>, info@viamed-eu.com <info@viamed-eu.com>, Noor
<noor@avens.ae>

Dear Team
Kindly provide me the best quote for the below item.
1. item: Oxygen Sensor
Part Number: OOM111
Brand : Viamed
1. Item: Oxygen Sensor
Part Number: OOM102-01
Brand: Envitec
1. Item: Oxygen Sensor
Part Number: OOM202
Brand : Envitec / Viamed

Awaiting for your quotation

Best Regards
Syed Ali
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