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Steve Nixon <office@viamed.co.uk> 27 May 2022 at 17:30

Reply-To: steve.nixon@vandagraphst.com
To: Laura Blundell <L.Blundell@jfdglobal.com>

Hi Laura
Please accept my apologies for the delay in getting back to you, we will process a pro-forma for two batches:

36 x 8010050 oxygen sensor. Ship mid July
24 x 8010050 oxygen sensor. Ship mid August

Do you want us to ship using our UPS account or ship via your DHL account (No. 95181396) as previously instructed
by Tony?

Can you please confirm that the above is in addition to the existing orders:

P.O. 62200044-4 Pro-forma invoice MST135318 12 sensors - These are ready to ship, can you please transfer
the pro-forma invoice payment.

P.O. 62200373 Pro-forma invoice MST135849 36 sensors - These are ready to ship, can you please transfer
the pro-forma invoice payment.

Regards

Steve

On Wed, 25 May 2022 at 09:15, Laura Blundell <L.Blundell@jfdglobal.com> wrote:

Hi all,

May | please have a quote for the following:

8010050 - OXYGEN CELL, NON MAGNETIC x QTY 60

We would require 36 x qty by mid July and the remaining 24 delivered by mid August.

Could you please include all relevant costs (shipping and certs, where required) to the address below:
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Unit 13, 21-25 Monro Avenue

Kirrawee, Sydney, NSW 2232

Thanks kindly,

Laura

Laura Blundell Purchasing Officer
L.Blundell@jfdglobal.com
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This email and any attachments are confidential and may contain proprietary information, some of which may be legally privileged. It is intended solely for the use of the individual or entity
to which it is addressed. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the author immediately by replying to this email, and then delete all copies of the e-mail from your system. If you

are not the intended recipient you must not use, disclose, distribute, copy, print or rely on this email

Steve

Steve Nixon
Director - Vandagraph Sensor Technologies Ltd.

Office: +44 (0)1535 634900
Mobile: +44 (0)7850 252267

Kate Griffiths <office@viamed.co.uk> 30 May 2022 at 10:52
Reply-To: kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
To: Janine Gill <janine.gill@vmsecure.me.uk>

Kind regards
Kate Griffiths

Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin staff to work from home,
and | am now working remotely. Telephone calls to the main office will be answered remotely, but please
continue to use email where possible.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
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E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in
reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542
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