27/05/2022, 09:01 FW: Purchase Order P10237381 - viamed.aqib.majeed@gmail.com - Gmail

M

FW: Purchase Order P10237381 inbox x

Lister, Joanne 07:45 (1 hou
to Agib.majeed@viamed.co.uk, UHSbuyingteam

Morning Aqib,
Yes please, could you go ahead with the order at the correct price of £59.40 each.
Kind regards,

Joouwwne Lister

Clinical Engineering, 023 8120 6900
University Hospitad Southampton
Available Mondaoy, Thawsday & Fridoy

e From: Rolfe, Nick

Sent: 26 May 2022 15:41
To: Lister, Joanne <Joanne.Lister@uhs.nhs.uk>
Subject: RE: Purchase Order

Hi Jo,

Yes please. | seem to have an out of date price list.

Regards Nick

Nick Rolfe

Senior Electronics Engineer

Clinical Engineering

Level A

South Academic Block

University Hospital Southampton NHS Foundation Trust
Southampton General Hospital

Southampton SO16 6YD

Tel: 023 8120 8681

From: Lister, Joanne <Joanne.Lister@uhs.nhs.uk>
Sent: 26 May 2022 15:34
To: Rolfe Nick <Nick Rolfe@miihs nhs 11k>
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